



BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name: **JANITORIAL SUPPLIES**
 Requisition No. **2021-1203**

Bid Date:
 Bid Opening Time:

3-Dec-21
 11:00 A.M.

#	Item Description	Unit Size	Est. Qty.	Baldwin Janitorial		Trusted and Dependable Solution	
				Unit Price	Subtotal	Unit Price	Subtotal
A	Waxed Sanitary Napkin Disposal Receptacle Liners	250/Case	20 Cases	\$13.22	\$264.40	\$26.59	\$531.80
B	GEM Urinal Screen Deodorizer	12/Pack	60 Packs	\$13.99	\$839.40	\$29.84	\$1,790.40
C	White Disposable Plastic Forks	1000/Case	20 Cases	\$9.91	\$198.20	\$41.73	\$834.60
D	White Disposable Plastic Spoons	1000/Case	10 Cases	\$9.91	\$99.10	\$13.23	\$132.30
E	Super Loop Green Mop Head	12/Case	15 Cases	\$100.00	\$1,500.00	\$221.58	\$3,323.70
F	Ready-to-use Glass/Window Cleaner, quart size	12/Case	20 Cases	\$37.32	\$746.40	\$43.84	\$876.80
G	Dispensable Foaming Hand Soap, one liter size, Gojo Botanical Scent	3/Box	125 Boxes	\$47.60	\$5,950.00	\$71.84	\$8,980
H	Luxury Anti-Bacterial Foam Hand Soap, Gojo 1500 ML under sink dispenser	2/Box	40 Boxes	\$41.96	\$1,678.40	\$244.54	\$9,781.60
I	Lysol Disinfectant Spray	19 oz. can	100 cans	\$5.53	\$553.00	\$12.00	\$1,200.00
J	Heavy Duty Scrubbing Sponges	Each	50 Each	\$1.39	\$69.50	NO BID	NO BID
K	Hypoallergenic Powder Laundry Detergent	40 lb. bucket	80 Buckets	\$23.16	\$1,852.80	\$36.01	\$2,880.80
L	Disinfecting Household Bleach, gallon size	6/Case	40 Cases	\$19.99	\$799.60	\$26.60	\$1,064.00
M	White Household Roll Paper Towels	30/Case	40 Cases	\$23.90	\$956.00	\$54.40	\$2,176.00
N	Jumbo Toilet Tissue, 12" roll	6/Case	400 Cases	\$26.21	\$10,484.00	\$35.15	\$14,060.00
O	Toilet Tissue, single roll, 2-ply	96/Case	40 Cases	\$29.99	\$1,199.60	\$48.59	\$1,943.60
P	Brown Hard Wound Towels	12/Case	10 Cases	\$19.95	\$199.50	\$28.43	\$284.30
Q	White Multi-Fold Towels, 9" x 9.25", 250 count pack	16/Case	200 Cases	\$22.26	\$4,452.00	\$66.83	\$13,366.00
R	Commercial Grade Trash Bags, 24" x 32", 0.50 mil	500/Case	60 Cases	\$22.66	\$1,359.60	\$68.76	\$4,125.60
S	Heavy Duty Grade Trash Bags, 38" x 58", 1.5 mil	100/Case	150 Cases	\$25.34	\$3,801.00	\$49.80	\$7,470.00
T	Industrial Grade Trash Bags, 38" x 63", 2.7 mil	50/Case	20 Cases	\$58.50	\$1,170.00	\$132.06	\$2,641.20
U	Kem-Zyme, 1 Gallon	4/Case	20 Cases	\$38.00	\$760.00	NO BID	NO BID
V	Dawn Ultra Dishwashing Liquid	9 oz. bottle	72 Bottles	\$1.43	\$102.96	NO BID	NO BID

W	Cascade Liquid Automatic Dishwashing Soap	45 oz. bottle	20 Bottles	\$4.20	\$84.00	NO BID	NO BID
Y	Pledge Furniture Spray	12.5 oz. can	40 Cans	\$6.49	\$259.60	NO BID	NO BID
AA	Replacement Dispensers for Foam Soap (Item G)	Each	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$81.00	\$2,430.15
BB	Replacement Dispensers for 12" Toilet Tissue (Item N)	Each	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$61.60	\$1,848.00
DD	Replacement Dispensers for Multifold Towels	Each	10 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$49.05	\$490.50
EE	Nitrile Exam Gloves, 8 mil, 12" cuff, large size	50/Box	150 Boxes	\$15.99	\$2,398.50	NO BID	NO BID
FF	Nitrile Exam Gloves, 8 mil, 12" cuff, extra-large size	50/Box	150 Boxes	\$15.99	\$2,398.50	NO BID	NO BID
GG	Nitrile Exam Gloves, 4.5 mil, 9" cuff, large size	100/Box	200 Boxes	\$11.99	\$2,398.00	NO BID	NO BID
HH	Nitrile Exam Gloves, 4.5 mil, 9" cuff, extra-large size	100/Box	200 Boxes	\$11.99	\$2,398.00	NO BID	NO BID
Notes				NO BID PRODUCTS IN RED		NO BID PRODUCTS IN RED	
Bid Amount GRAND TOTAL				\$48,972.06		\$82,231.35	

Tabulated by T. Smith 12/03/21