



BID TABULATION SHEET

NAME: MOSQUITO CONTROL PRODUCTS

Bid Date: 3/2/2023

REQUISITION # 2023-0302

Bid Opening Time: 10:00AM

Bidder's Name	Target Specialty Products	BWI	ADAPCO	Clarke Mosquito Control
City, State	Lake Mary, FL	Meridian, MS	Lake Mary, FL	St. Illinois
Affidavits	Signed and Received	Signed and Received	Signed and Received	Signed and Received
Addenda Received				
Notes				
ITEMS BID:				
Masterline Bifenthrin Concentrate 7.9	\$ 54.66	\$ 46.58	\$ 55.40	NO BID
Summit BTI Briquettes	\$ 108.00	\$ 71.60	NO BID	\$ 133.00
DeltaGard 2% Deltamethrin Concentrate	\$ 7,470.00	\$ 9,257.89	NO BID	NO BID
Aqua-Kontrol 3030 30% Permethrin Concentrate	\$ 4,137.00	NO BID	\$ 3,375.00	\$ 2,400.30
AquaNeat Herbicide	\$ 1,286.13	\$ 794.40	NO BID	NO BID
MaxForce Granulated Fly Bait Ready to Use	\$ 55.25	\$ 51.47	NO BID	NO BID
Fyfanon EW Mosquito 40.9% Malathion	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,953.30	NO BID
VectoBac WDG 37.4 Bacillus thuringiensis solid strain AM65-52 water dispersible granular	NO BID	\$ 476.20	\$ 1,031.28	NO BID
		16lb case	24LB CASE	
VectoLex WDG 51.2% Bacillus Sphaericus strain ABTS 1743 Water Dispersible granular	NO BID	\$ 425.52	\$ 1,532.40	NO BID
VectoMax WSP 4.5% Bacillus Thuringiensis & 2.7% Bacillus Sphaericus water soluble pouches, up to 8 weeks of control	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,576.00	NO BID
			800 WSP/CASE	
VectoLex WSP 7.5% Bacillus Sphaericus Strain ABTS 1743 water soluble pouches, up to 4 weeks of control	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 850.00	NO BID
			800 WSP/CASE	
Altosid XR Briquets 150 day slow release	\$ 818.41	\$ 1,115.28	\$ 476.00	\$ 818.40
	220 PER CASE	240 PER CASE	200 PER CASE	220 PER CASE
Permethrin 30 30. - Vector, Adulticides, Midge/Fly Control, Mosquito ControlProducts, 30% Permethrin 30% Piperonyl Butoxide Permethrin,Piperonyl Butoxide	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 1,198.28	\$ 2,732.10	\$ 4,400.55
	30 GALLON DRUM	55 GALLON DRUM	30 GALLON DRUM	55 GALLON DRUM
Fyfanon EW. Vector Adulticides, mosquito control products, 40.9% malathion	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1,953.30	NO BID
Methoprene 150 day larvacide tabs or briquettes. Case quantities. 220 per case 60 cases/pallet	\$ 818.40	NO BID	\$ 476.00	\$ 818.40
	220 PER CASE		200 PER CASE	220 PER CASE
VectoBac WDG – 24x1lb containers, Vector, 51.2% Bacillus sphaericus	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Round Up – Type Herbicide Market- Aquatic Format- Post-Emergent Active- Glyphosate Category- Chem Vendor: Bayner - Non-Agency	\$ 1,286.13	\$ 917.54	NO BID	NO BID
MINIMUM ORDER FOR FREE DELIVERY:	\$ 300.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -
SHIPPING FEES:	\$ -	\$ 35.00	\$ -	\$ -

TABULATED BY: SHELBY DEBLIEUX - PURCHASING OFFICER