A
GULF (¢ SHORES

ALADARMA

AGENDA
GULF SHORES CITY COUNCIL
COUNCIL WORK SESSION MEETING
JUNE 15, 2020
4:00 P.M.

1. Councilmember Discussion Period
A. Councilman Joe Garris, Jr.

2. Finance And Administrative Services Department
A. 2019 Comprehensive Annual Financial Report (Audit)

Documents:

FIN - AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY - COMPREHENSIVE ANNUAL FINANCIAL
REPORT (AUDIT).PDF

3. Planning And Community Development
A. PUD Amendment Request - The Retreat At Bon Secour West

Documents:

ZA - AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY - THE RETREAT AT BON SECOUR WEST
PUD AMENDMENT.PDF

ZA - THE RETREAT AT BON SECOUR WEST PUD MOD STAFF
REPORT.PDF

ZA - THE RETREAT AT BON SECOUR WEST PUD AMENDMENT
APPLICANT NARRATIVE.PDF

ZA - THE RETREAT AT BON SECOUR WEST PUD AMENDMENT
PLANS.PDF

4. Public Works Department
A. Award Heavy Equipment Rental Bid

Documents:

PW - AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY - EQUIPMENT RENTAL BID.PDF
PW - HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL BID TAB.PDF

5. Zoning Administrator
A. Bicycle & Pedestrian Advisory Committee Appointment - Dey, Coleman

Documents:



ZA - AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY - BICYCLE AND PEDESTRIAN ADVISORY
COMMITTEE APPOINTMENTS -DEY, COLEMAN.PDF

6. Mayor Updates

7. Adjourn


https://www.gulfshoresal.gov/743e95a5-b92c-4d9b-8f4a-ac23b50f9176

C\!_IL_;S__HORESN SMALL TOWN, BIG BEACH

e —
ALABAMA

COUNCIL AGENDA SUMMARY

TO: Mayor Craft & Members of the City Council

FROM: Cindy King, Finance & Administration Director
SUBJECT: 2019 Comprehensive Annual Financial Report (Audit)
DATE: June 12, 2020

ISSUE: Annual City financial audit results: Revenues exceeded expenditures by $3,028,947.
The $3,028,047 added to the City General Fund balance of $36,624,645 resulting in a fund
balance at 2019 year-end of $39,653,492. The City’s fund balance goal is 70% of revenues or
expenditures. The fund balance of $39,653,492 represents the following for 2019:

85% of expenditures of $46,694,683 (includes transfers out for debt service)
80% of revenues of $49,723,630 (includes transfers in from the Beach fund)

No major findings were reported for the City.

Assets exceeded liabilities by $105,255,566 and increased by $11,686,206 from 2018 year
end. The assets increased by the payoff of $2 million for East Gulf Place parking, $8.5 million
for school improvements to be repaid by the school and $4.35 million for property for a future
medical facility offset by future debt service payments.

Governmental Revenues increased by $8.49 million to $53,855,862 reflecting:
Full year’s collection of the increase in Lodging Tax from 5% to 7% = $3 million
Other local tax (Sales, Alcohol, Gas) increases in collections of $1 million
State of Alabama tax increase of $2.955 million mainly for NRDA/Laguna Cove grant
Licenses & Permits increase of $606,475 reflecting increased construction permits
Impact Fee increase of $493K; Property Tax increase of $134K: and $303K Interest increase

Governmental Expenses decreased by $1.285 million due to reduced principal and interest
recorded.

BACKGROUND: The City Financial Audit is conducted annually by the accounting firm
Grant, Sanders & Taylor with an extensive review of city accounting records and procedures.

PREVIOUS COUNCIL ACTION: None

BUDGET IMPLICATIONS: Annual Audit Expense of $76,000 included in 2020 budget.

Post Office Box 299
Gulf Shores, AL 36547



RELATED ISSUES: The City has received the Government Finance Officers Association
Certificate of Achievement for Excellence in Financial Reporting for 9 consecutive years
and will apply for the award for the 2019 audit as well.

ATTACHMENTS: 2019 Comprehensive Annual Financial Report excerpts
DEPARTMENT: Finance & Administration

STAFF CONTACT: Cindy King



ASSETS

Current Cash and Cash Equivalents
Reserve Current Cash and Cash Equivalents
Receivables (Net)
Due from component units
Inventories
Prepaids and Other Assets
Restricted Assets:

Cash and Cash Equivalents
Capital Assets:

Non - Deprecisbie

Depreciable (Net)

Total Assets

DEFERRED OUTFLOW OF RESOQOURCES
Defeasance cost, net
Deferred OPEB outflows
Deferred employer pension contributions

Total Deferred Outflow of Resources

LIABILITIES
Accounts Payable
Accrued Liabilities
Accrued Interest Payable
Non - Current Liabilities
Due Within One Year:
Compensated absences
Bonds Payable
Lease payable
Due In More than One Year:
Compensated absences
Proportionate share of OPEB liability
Lease payable
Net Pension Liability
Bonds Payahie

Total Liabilities

DEFERRED INFLOW OF RESOURCES
Deferred Revenue
Proportionate share of collective inflows
related to OPEB liability
Deferred employer pension contributions

Total Deferred Inflow of Resources

NET POSITION:
Net Investment in Capital Assets

Restricted for:
Debt service
Beach restoration

Unrestrictad
Total Net Position

The accompanying notes are an integral
part of the financial statements.

THE CITY OF GULF SHORES, ALABAMA

STATEMENT OF NET POSITION

DRAFT

DECEMBER 31, 2019
Primary Government Component Units
Gulf Shores Jack
Governmental Business-Type City School Edwards Airport

Activities Activities Total System Alrport Authority
$ 16,818,633 % 2780 § 16,821,413 § 1,782,624 § - 3 538,846
18,804,442 - 18,804,442 - - -
4,982,966 - 4,982,966 246,068 54,465 17,344
10,049,218 - 10,049,218 - . -
101,395 - 101,395 40,488 718,623 -
476,965 - 476,965 - - 5,201
19,298,151 508,414 20,406,565 - 621,036 -
52,971,569 3,792,843 56,764,412 6,079,353 6,346,391 93,938
72,409,077 8,485,662 80,894,739 21,383,525 9,759,927 50817
196,512,416 12,789,699 209,302,115 29,532,058 17,500,442 706,146
1,852,684 - 1,852,684 - - -

- - - 544,781 - -
2,600,179 - 2,600,179 - - -
4,452,863 - 4,452,863 544,781 - -

3 2,187,111 § 52 3 2,187,163 § 429274 § 55,558 % -
1,492,137 - 1,492,137 - - -
83,834 3i4,390 398,233 - - -
89,716 - 89,716 - - -
6,455,555 190,000 6,645,555 - - -
106,405 - 106,405
1,424,542 - 1,424,542 - - -
- - - 129,774 - -
100,728 - 100,728 - “ -
6,176,891 - 6,176,891 - - -
76,860,147 10,313,401 87,173,548 13,760,043 - -
94,977,066 10,817,852 105,794,918 14,319,091 55,558 -
517,958 - 517,958 16,136 - -

- - - 7,016 - -
2,186,537 - 2,186,537 - - -
2,704,495 - 2,704 495 23,152 - -

31,547,784 2,283,518 33,831,302 13,702,835 16,106,318 144,755
651 - 651 , - -
3,010,399 - 3,010,399 - - -
68,724,885 (311,671) 68.413.214 2,031,761 1,338,566 561,391
103,283,719 1,971,847 105,255,566 15,734,596 17,444,884 706,146
28
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THE CITY OF GULF SHORES, ALABAMA

ASSETS
Current Assets:
Cash and cash equivalents
Restricted cash and cash equivalents
Total Current Assets

Capital Assets:
Land
Land improvements
Buildings
Furniture and equipment
Construction in progress
Less: accumulated depreciation
Total Non-Current Assets
Total Assets

LIABILITIES
Current Liabilities:
Construction cost payable
Bonds payable
Accrued interest payable
Total Current Liabilities

Non-Current Liabitities:
Due within one year:
Bonds payable
Total Liabilities

NET POSITION
Net Investment in Capital Assets
Restricted
Unrestricted

Total Net Position

The accompanying notes are an integral
part of the financial statements.

ALL PROPRIETARY FUND TYPES
STATEMENT OF NET POSITION
AS OF DECEMBER 31, 2019

36

DRAFT

Business-type Activities

Enterprise Funds

Primary Government

Non-major Fund

Public Education
Building Authority

2,780
508,414

511,194

3,792,843
203,087
9,174,654
261,893

(1,153,972)

12,278,505

12,789,699

52
190,000
314,399

504,451

10,313,401

10,817,852

2,283,518

(311,670)

1,971,848




THE CITY OF GULF SHORES, ALABAMA

STATEMENT OF REVENUES, EXPENSES, AND CHANGES IN NET PODJ\I I "

ALL PROPRIETARY FUND TYPES
FOR THE YEAR ENDED DECEMBER 31, 2019

Business-type Activities
Enterprise Funds

Primary Government

Non-major Fand

Fublic Edecation
Building Authority

Operating Revenues

Auburn rent $ 609,050
Operating Expenses

Depreciation 21,480
Operating Income (Loss) 587,570
Non-Operating Revenues (Expenses)

Interest & dividend income 6,080

Amortization of bond premium 30,479

Interest expense (528,274)

Total Non-Operating Expenses (491,715)

Change in Net Position 95,855
Net Position - Beginning 1,875,993
Net Position - Ending 1,971,848

The accompanying notes are an integral
part of the financial statements.
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THE CITY OF GULF SHORES, ALABAMA
ALL PROPRIETARY FUND TYPES
STATEMENT OF CASH FLOWS
FOR THE YEAR ENDED DECEMBER 31, 2019

Business-type Activities
Enterprise Funds
Primary Government
Nop-major Fund

Public Education
Building Authority
CASH FLOWS FROM OPERATING ACTIVITIES
Payments from leases and other operating activities $ 609,050
CASH FLOWS FROM CAPITAL AND
RELATED FINANCING ACTIVITIES
Acquistion and construction of capital assets {69,139)
Construction cost payable {237,075)
Decrease in restricted bond funds 301,739
Principal payment (185,000)
Accrued interest (425,900)
Net cash provided (used) by francing activities (615,375)
CASH FLOWS FROM INVESTING ACTIVITIES
Interest payments received 6,080
Net cash provided (used) by investing activities 6,080
Net increase (decrease) in cash and cash equivalents (245)
Cash balance - beginning of year 3,025
Cash balance - end of year 3 2,780

RECONCILIATION OF OPERATING INCOME (LOSS)

TO NET CASH PROVIDED (USED) BY OPERATING ACTIVITIES

Operating income (loss) $ 587,570
Adjustments to reconcile operating income to net

cash provided (used) by operating activities:

Depreciation 21,480
Net cash provided (used) by operating activities 3 609,050

Noncash Investing, Capital and Financing Activities: None

The accompanying notes are an integral
part of the financial statements. 38
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CITY OF y
GULF ({/ SHORES AL TOWN, 516 BEACH

—

TO: Mayor Craft & Members of the City Council
FROM: Lee Jones, Director of Planning & Community Development
SUBJECT: ZA19-000071 The Retreat at Bon Secour West PUD Amendment

DATE: June 15, 2020

REQUEST: The applicant seeks to amend the Bon Secour Village PUD Master Plan to:

e Increase the approved number of lots in the western portion of Bon Secour Village from
21 to 28 lots.

This application is being processed as a PUD Modification, and requires public hearings before
both the Planning Commission and City Council.

SITE LOCATION: The 7.31 acre property is located on Waterway West Boulevard directly
west of existing residential development along Bienville Avenue. The primary land uses in the
vicinity of this development are the existing single family houses associated with Bon Secour
Village.

BACKGROUND:

2005 — The property was rezoned from ICW Intracoastal Waterway zoning district to
RPC Residential Planned Community. RPC approval was granted to construct an 83-lot,
single family subdivision.

2012 — The subject 7.31 acre parcel was rezoned to R-4 as part of a larger rezoning that
affected 320 acres of the Bon Secour Village property.

2017 — The City applied a PUD Overlay to the property, and combined it with the Bon
Secour Village PUD. Preliminary subdivision plat was also granted by the Planning
Commission for a 21 lot single family house subdivision named The Retreat at Bon
Secour Village.

PLANNING COMMISSION: At the January 28, 2020 meeting the Commission voted 8-0 to
recommend approval of the Bon Secour Village PUD Amendment application with conditions.

RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends approval of the PUD amendment with the
following conditions:

1. A waiver is granted to allow the brick paver sidewalks to be 5’ in width instead of the
standard 6°.

2. The City will not take over maintenance of the brick paver sidewalks.

3. The applicant shall record and reference on the final plat covenants and restrictions with



standards for Lots 1-4, requiring architectural treatments so the houses on these lots
“front” on the street and Intracoastal Waterway.
4. A separate construction entrance shall be provided from the development to Waterway
West Boulevard to prevent construction traffic from traversing Bienville Avenue. The
construction entrance from Waterway West Boulevard shall remain in place until 75% of
the houses in this phase have obtained a Certificate of Occupancy.
The existing alley way west of lots 1-9 shall not connect to the proposed cul-de-sac.
6. The cul-de-sac be shifted a minimum 6 feet northward and the area between the cul-de-
sac and the existing Lot 1 of Bon Secour Village shall be landscaped.

o

ATTACHMENTS: Staff Report and Plans



cITY oF

CULF SHORES SMALL TOWN, BIG BEACH"
——

ALABAMA

The Retreat at Bon Secour West - PUD Amendment

Staff Report: Lee Jones COW Meeting Date: June 15, 2020
Application #:ZA19-000071 Applicant: GCOF Bon Secour LLC Property Location: Waterway West Blvd

STAFF RECOMMENDATION: APPROVE WITH CONDITIONS

SUMMARY OF REQUEST
The applicant seeks to amend the Bon Secour Village PUD Master Plan to increase the approved number
of lots in the western portion of Bon Secour Village from 21 to 28 lots.

SURROUNDING CONTEXT
The 7.31 acre property is located on Waterway West Boulevard directly west of existing residential
development along Bienville Avenue. The primary land uses in the vicinity of this development are the
existing single family houses associated with Bon Secour Village.

e East - the original 83-lot single family subdivision, Bon Secour Village Phase 1,and southeast is a

small portion of R-2 zoning that is outside of the Bon Secour Village PUD

e North - a large undeveloped BN zoned property

e South - the Intracoastal Waterway

e West - undeveloped R-4 zoned land

BACKGROUND
2005 — The property was rezoned from ICW Intracoastal Waterway zoning district to RPC Residential
Planned Community. RPC approval was granted to construct an 83-lot, single family subdivision. The
RPC master plan utilized Traditional Neighborhood Development principles, such as narrow lots, front
porches, raised finish floors, alley access, reduced setbacks, formal open spaces, and a system of
well-connected streets and blocks. A SmartCode development handbook was adopted with the RPC
containing standards for the development of the property.

2012 — The subject 7.31 acre parcel was rezoned to R-4 as part of a larger rezoning that affected 320
acres of the Bon Secour Village property.

2017 — The City applied a PUD Overlay to the property, and combined it with the Bon Secour Village
PUD. Preliminary subdivision plat was also granted by the Planning Commission for a 21 lot single
family house subdivision named The Retreat at Bon Secour Village. The Retreat was designed to be
more of a suburban type subdivision as opposed to the original design of Bon Secour Village with
larger front loaded lots and a looped cul-de-sac roadway.

January 28, 2020: Planning Commission Meeting - The Planning Commission recommended that
Council approve the applicant’s request to amend this section of the Bon Secour Village PUD from a
21-lot subdivision along a cul-de-sac street to a 28-lot subdivision. The Commission added two
conditions to the recommendation: 1.) provide a separate construction entrance from Waterway
West: and 2.) the cul-de-sac shall not connect to the existing alley behind existing lots along Bienville.

There were a number of residents from Bon Secour Village at the Planning Commission meeting who
had questions and/or voiced concerns about the PUD amendment. The Planning Commission
encouraged the developer to meet with the residents and try to address some of the concerns.

March 12, 2020: Developer and Bon Secour Village Homeowners Meeting. Representatives of
the developer held a meeting with the homeowners of Bon Secour Village. Planning and Zoning staff
attended the meeting. Major topics of discussion included providing a separate construction entrance
from Waterway West to the new 28-lot subdivision and replacing the cul-de-sac with a northern
roadway connection to Bienville Avenue.



May 27, 2020: Planning Commission Meeting — The Planning Commission approved The Retreat
at Bon Secour West Preliminary Subdivision Plat with a condition the cul-de-sac be shifted a
minimum 6 feet northward and the area between the cul-de-sac and the existing Lot 1 of Bon Secour
Village be landscaped. Staff recommends this condition be added to the PUD Amendment
application.

FUTURE LAND USE PLAN
High Density Residential - The Future Land Use Plan designates this property as High Density
Residential (11-25 dwelling units per acre). High-density residential uses are mostly multi-family
condominiums located within the beach area and in more limited instances adjacent to the larger
commercial, institutional and employment activity centers and corridors.

PROPOSED PUD AMENDMENT
The applicant proposes to modify the Bon Secour Village PUD to increase the number of lots within
this phase of the development. The Zoning Ordinance designates any increase in density within an
approved PUD as a “Major Amendment.” Major Amendments may only be made through the
rezoning process, therefore the proposed amendment will require public hearings before the both the
Planning Commission and City Council.

Details of the request are as follows.

Number of Lots: 28

Lot Sizes: 5,222sf to 9,966sf

Setbacks: 12’ to 18’ front yard, 12’ total for the side yards, and 15’ rear yard setbacks

Dedicated Open Space: .81 acres (11%)

Extension of Bienville Avenue to terminate in a cul-de-sac

Front-loaded lots (driveway in the front of the house) as opposed to rear-loaded (access

from the rear of the house)

¢ Requested waiver to allow a 5’ sidewalk instead of the required 6’ sidewalk, in order to
match the existing sidewalk width within Bon Secour Village

¢ Intracoastal Waterway Pedestrian Path extension to the western property line with this

phase

ANALYSIS

Plan Review

Development Form. As stated above, the applicant seeks to amend the approved Bon Secour
Village PUD to increase the number of lots in the western phase from 21 to 28 lots. The original
Bon Secour Village Phase 1 Subdivision was designed to be a traditional neighborhood
development with a wide range of lot sizes and building types. Traditional neighborhood
developments are intended to decrease in intensity from the center to the edge. The center of
the current development contains a more urban form of development with small lots and minimal
setbacks to allow the houses to front on the streets and cover a majority of the lot. The proposed
lots are on average larger than existing lots, and the housing types are more typical of a
suburban subdivision. The transition to a more suburban housing type along the edge of the
development is consistent with the original TND concept.

The proposed addition to Bon Secour Village is designed with some suburban characteristics,
e.g. larger lots, a cul-de-sac street, while keeping some of the original design components such
as small building setbacks, large building coverage allowances, and brick paver sidewalks. All of
the proposed lots within The Retreat at Bon Secour are separated from the existing lots in Bon
Secour Village Phase 1 either by landscape buffers or existing alleys and streets. These design
elements provide a transition between the urban form of Bon Secour Village Phase 1 Subdivision
and the proposed suburban lots. The applicant indicates the proposed housing types will be
similar in style and size as the existing housing within Bon Secour Village.



Waterfront Lots. Lots 1-4 of the proposed subdivision front on both Bienville Avenue and the
common area along the Intracoastal Waterway. In order to avoid having a situation where these
houses front on the ICW and have the rear of each house on Bienville Avenue, staff has included
a condition that these lots shall be architecturally designed to have two “fronts.” The expectation
is that the homes will be oriented to both the ICW and the street through the integration of
architectural treatments, porches, balconies, doors, and windows along both frontages. Any
fencing proposed along the ICW shall be a maximum of 4’ in height and shall otherwise meet all
standards of the development. This condition will avoid having the rears of houses facing the
fronts of houses across the street, as well as placing the “face” of the houses along the waterway.

Density. The proposed density of the subdivision is 3.8 units per acre. The proposed land use is
single family residential. Both the density and land use are far less dense and intense than is
envisioned by the High-Density Residential land use category for this area, as designated by the
Future Land Use Plan.

Traffic Circulation. Prior to the January 28th Planning Commission meeting, Planning and Zoning
staff recommended several alternatives to the applicant for providing additional street
connections and eliminating the proposed cul-de-sac. Alternatives included: 1.) a street
connection through the existing platted common area, in line with Orleans St; 2.) a new street
connection into the proposed subdivision from Waterway West; and 3.) a “close” (loop street) that
included open space in its center. The applicant chose to move forward with the currently
proposed cul-de-sac.

At the January 28th Planning Commission meeting, Bon Secour Village residents expressed
concerns about the proposed cul-de-sac. Many residents voiced support for eliminating the cul-
de-sac, requesting an additional street connection to Bienville, similar to the Orleans St.
connection to the east. This connection would cross an existing common area, eliminate the
proposed cul-de-sac, and provide an additional access to the proposed 28 lots. This request was
made by the neighbors in order to reduce traffic generated from the proposed subdivision along
Bienville.

During the Planning Commission meeting, the applicant indicated the connection was not
possible because of legal issues with the existing common area. These legal issues would
prohibit the roadway connection across the common area. Donald Stewart, the City Attorney,
reviewed the legal issues regarding the street connection at staff's request. Mr. Stewart was
unable to find any legal issues prohibiting the street connection.

Staff has continued to work with the applicant to find a solution that achieves the developer’s
goals while addressing the neighbors’ concerns about increased traffic on an existing street, but
that solution has remained elusive. The proposed subdivision and cul-de-sac, as designed, are
consistent with the requirements of the Subdivision Regulations, with the exception of sidewalk
widths and material.

Construction Entrance. Staff has worked with the developer to determine a location for a
construction entrance from Waterway West Boulevard into the proposed subdivision. The
construction entrance will eliminate construction traffic from utilizing the existing roads within Bon
Secour Village. Staff recommends that the construction entrance from Waterway West Boulevard
remain in place until 75% of the houses in this phase have obtained a Certificate of Occupancy.



A comparison of Bon Secour Village Phase 1, the 2017 PUD modification, and the proposed
amended plan is provided below.
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Bon Secour Village Ph. 1

2017 Approval

Proposed Plan

Lot Sizes 2,720sf — 9,660sf 4,542sf -22,156sf 5,222sf-9,9665sf

Setbacks Front- 12’-18’, Sides-12’ Front — 12’-18’, Sides — 12’ totall, Front — 12’-18’, Sides — 12’ total, Rear -
total, Rear — 3’ Rear -15’ 15’

Lot Widths 27-103’ 40’ -85’ 52’-98’

Number of Lots 83 21 28

Density

5.3 units per acre

2.8 units per acre

3.8 units per acre

Building Height

60’ principle bldg, 40’
accessory bldg

30’ for both principal and accessory
bldgs

30’ for both principal and accessory bldgs

Housing Access

Rear alley loaded

Front loaded

Front loaded

Building
Coverage

75%

75%

75%

Open Space

.38 acres (2.45%)

.99 acres (13.5%)

.80 acres (11%)

RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends the City Council approve the PUD Amendment with the following conditions.

1.
2.
3

A waiver is granted to allow the brick paver sidewalks to be 5’ in width instead of the standard 6’.
The City will not take over maintenance of the brick paver sidewalks.

The applicant shall record and reference on the final plat covenants and restrictions with
standards for Lots 1-4, requiring architectural treatments so the houses on these lots “front” on
the street and Intracoastal Waterway.
A separate construction entrance shall be provided from the development to Waterway West
Boulevard to prevent construction traffic from traversing Bienville Avenue. The construction
entrance from Waterway West Boulevard shall remain in place until 75% of the houses in this
phase have obtained a Certificate of Occupancy.
The existing alley way west of lots 1-9 shall not connect to the proposed cul-de-sac.

The cul-de-sac be shifted a minimum 6 feet northward and the area between the cul-de-sac and
the existing Lot 1 of Bon Secour Village shall be landscaped.

The Retreat at Bon Secour Village Location Map







BON SECOUR VILLAGE
PUD STANDARDS
(Revised 12-9-19)

Bon Secour Village West is the 7.31 acre site that was approved in September, 2017 as an
addition to the existing Bon Secour Village Planned Unit Development (PUD). This is a
modification to that portion of the PUD.

The original Bon Secour Village Phase 1 of the PUD, approved in 2005, consisted of 83 single
family lots. In September, 2017, the original PUD was modified to add Bon Secour Village
West, adding 21 single family lots, bringing the overall total to 104 lots. Recently a request was
made for an administrative approval to resubdivide 15 lots in Bon Secour Village Phase 1 to 10
lots, reducing the total number of lots in Phase 1 from 83 to 78 lots. This modification is a
request to increase the number of lots in Bon Secour Village West from 21 lots to 28 lots. The
result of the administrative request and this modification request is an addition of 2 lots to the
overall PUD, with the proposed total being 106 lots.

In 2012, Bon Secour Village South, adjacent to but not zoned as a part of the original PUD, was
approved with 19 single family lots and 6 duplex lots. The total number of lots within the
proposed PUD modification and Bon Secour Village South will now be 137 lots/units. There was
also a revision made to the Bon Secour Village South subdivision to increase the amenity area to
1.34 acres. The amenity area consists of a pool/cabana and parking area and is for the use of the
Bon Secour Village PUD and Bon Secour Village South residents.

The lot sizes for the 28 lots in the revised Bon Secour Village West, range from 5,222 square feet
to 9,966 square feet. The total area for the Bon Secour Village PUD and Bon Scour Village
South is 32.78 acres. The total open/green space for the Bon Secour Village PUD and Bon
Secour Village South is 3.87 acres or 11.81% of the total 32.78 acres.

All the following PUD standards that were part of the previously approved PUD modification
remain unchanged and still apply to this modification.

The residential lots shall have the following standards: The setbacks will be 12° minimum or 18’
maximum for the front, 15" minimum for the rear, 12’ total or 0" attached for the side, and 12’
street side. The maximum height for principal buildings for all residential lots is to be 30°. The
maximum building coverage of each residential lot is to be 75%. Accessory buildings are
allowed with a maximum building height of 30°.

The roadway within the development will be public and will be constructed in accordance with
City design standards. The City of Gulf Shores Subdivision Regulations requires 6° wide
sidewalks. A waiver is requested from this requirement to allow 5* wide brick sidewalks, to
match the existing sidewalks within the existing PUD. Sidewalks will be located on both sides of
the proposed roadway, required to be ADA compliant and constructed in accordance to the
standards of the City of Gulf Shores. Sidewalks will be installed during subdivision construction



of the infrastructure and will be maintained by the property owners association and not the City
of Gulf Shores.

All utilities will be constructed underground and in accordance to the standards of the respective
utility companies. Street lights will be maintained by the property owners association and not the
City of Gulf Shores.

The stormwater management system will be designed in accordance with the standards of the
City of Gulf Shores. All stormwater facilities and structures outside of public right-of-ways will
be maintained by the property owners association and not the City of Gulf Shores.

Landscape plans are provided with this PUD application. All landscaping will be installed during
construction of the infrastructure unless bonding of the street trees are allowed by the City.

A Declaration to amend the existing Covenants and Restrictions will provide for the addition of
this phase of development to provide for maintenance responsibilities of the drainage
infrastructure outside of public roadways, and maintenance of the common areas.

The original Bon Secour Village PUD was designed with the Bon Secour West property to
eventually be a part of the overall PUD. With the changes in the market and changes in
ownership those plans ultimately went away. This revision to add this to the existing PUD is in
keeping with the original plan. Lot sizes and design standards are very similar to the existing
development.



Dewberry

25353 Friendship Road Daphne, AL 36526
251.990.9950 fax 251.990-9910

info@dewberry.com
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BON SECOUR VILLAGE

(A PLANNED UNIT DEVELOPMENT)

ORGINAL PUD APPROVED: 2005
BON SECOUR VILLAGE SOUTH APPROVED: 2012

MODIFICATION APPROVED: SEPT. 25, 2017
PROPOSED MODIFICATION: DEC. 9, 2019 L
BON SECOUR VILLAGE SOUTH APPROVED: 2012
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OWNER/DEVELOPER
GCOF BON SECOUR LLC

29891 WOODROW LANE

SPANISH FORT, AL 36527

PROPERTY IS LOCATED IN THE XX OF SECTION XX,
TOWNSHIP 9 SOUTH, RANGE 3 EAST, BALDWIN COUNTY, ALABAMA.
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SITE DATA

(BON SECOUR VILLAGE WEST ONLY)

ZONING: PUD

PROPOSED USE: SINGLE FAMILY
LIN. FT. STREETS: 1,098 LF
NUMBER OF LOTS: 28

SMALLEST LOT: 5,222 SF (LOT 28)
LARGEST LOT: 9,966 SF (LOT 23)
MAX. BLDG. COVERAGE: 75%
MAX. PINCIPAL BLDG. HEIGHT: 30'
MAX. ACCESSORY BLDG. HEIGHT: 30'
COMMON AREAS: 1.66 AC (22.7%)
OPEN SPACE: 0.80 AC (11%)

TOTAL AREA: 7.31 AC

REQUIRED SETBACKS:
FRONT: 12' MIN./18' MAX.
REAR: 15' MIN.

SIDE: 12' TOTAL/0' ATTACHED
SIDE STREET: 12 FEET

PUD MODIFICATIONS

WEST:
28 LOT SINGLE-FAMILY DEVELOPMENT (21 PREVIOUSLY)

PHASE 1:

15 SINGLE-FAMILY LOTS TO 10 SINGLE-FAMILY LOTS
(APPROVED ADMINISTRATIVELY)

W:ANATHAN\50115280 - BON SECOUR WEST (NEW CONTRACT)\PLANNING\50115280 - PUD MOD.dwg
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BALDWIN COUNTY RD-4 (AKA-BON SECOUR AVENUE) 100' R.O.W.

NOT CONSTRUCTION
THESE PLANS HAVE NOT BEEN APPROVED
BY THE GOVERNING AGENCY
AND ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE.
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BALDWIN COUNTY RD-4 (AKA-BON SECOUR AVENUE) 100' R.O.W.
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FORM 3 SET ROOTBALL CROWN
CONTINUOUS 1 ” HIGHER
SAUCER AROUND THAN SURROUNDING
PLANTING PIT — FINISHED GRADE. ARBORGUY TREE ANCHOR '
SYSTEM, INSTALL APPROPRIATE
i%ogfci'#ﬂfHE@&R?SEM TENSION BAR MODEL PER MANUFACTURER’S
ROOTBALL. NSTRUCTIONS /
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MULCH TO DEPTH
AT WATER WELL. 1" GUYLINE

218 N. Alston Street, Foley, Alabama 36535

ARROWHEAD ANCHOR Telephone 251.948.7181  Facsimile 2519818722
ﬁ I ; FlNlSHED GRADE_ WEBB'NG www.was-design.com
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= SIENA e sli=1ls | RIAS ==
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\ BACKFILL WITH A MIXTURE T = == Aﬁg I:E ggg/fggT'N%AgﬁﬁﬁéE
OF PLANTING PIT SPOIL T T .
2 X ROOTBALL AND PREPARED PLANTING | EXISTING
SOIL, PER SPECS, FROM SUBSOIL
ADJACENT PLANTING AREA
—— UNDISTURBED SUBGRADE
PLANT SCHEDULE ] SHRUB PLANTING STAKING DETAIL
TREES CODE  QTY BOTANICAL NAME COMMON NAME CONT CAL  HT REMARKS 1" = 1-7 DETAIL—FILE SET ROOTBALL CROWN 1 1/2” HIGHER
THAN THE SURROUNDING FINISHED
GRADE. SLOPE BACKFILL AWAY FROM .\Q
BH 17 Betula nigra River Birch N/A 12 Min.3 trunks ROOTBALL FOR POSITIVE DRAINAGE. VA
PLANTING AT, « PLANTING AT
) TURF AREAS. ¢ > SHRUB AREAS. Q
2’%“- MGC 16 Magnolia grandiflora “Claudia Wannamaker Claudia W. Magnolia N/A 3"Cal 12° Full to Ground KEEP TURF CLEAR FOR A 24" KEEP MULCH 27 — 37
o RADIUS CIRCLE AROUND” THE FROM BASE OF TREE.
TREE. MULCH WITH A 3" THICK
Qv 34 Quercus virginiana Southern Live Oak N/A 3"Cal 12° Full head, specimen quality LAYER OF SHREDDED BARK. | /I&AFEJE_EHTOW%T’EFE)EV;IJ%L
A TRENCH EDGE, RE:—— ] 3" HIGH WATER 5
D 6 Taxodium distichum Bald Cypress N/A 3'Cal 12 Full head, specimen quality N DETAIL Nerh AT SHRUB w
' eeeeeeee%e FINISHED GRADE ' C
B 31 ATATAT AT AT AT AT AR A AT LAWN. / FINISHED GRADE @
[+ T+ + T+ T+ ) T, ST\AT SHRUBS.
SHRUBS CODE QTY BOTANICAL NAME COMMON NAME CONT HT SPACING  REMARKS AeAeﬁ&&&&eA&ﬁ — \'\”\““’"‘fL WAEY AT '\‘ 9; ©
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'_ —_— R P
3 ] Hl= S L g
xxr L L L L . — > w
SB3 13 Spartina bakeri Sand Cord G 1 gal 42" o0, B SHRUBS AND GROUNDCOVERS ADJACENT TO CURVED EDGES SHALL V === =
{S} partina bakerl and Lordrass g4 o-¢ BE PLANTED IN ROWS PARALLEL TO THE CURVED EDGES. CURVED ST TN 8 S o
EDGES TO BE VERY SMOOTH RADII. SPECIFIED PLANTING |_ 2X ROOTBALL N _8
@ SB 54 Viburnum odoratissimum Sweet Viburnum 3 gal 60" o.c. MIX. ~ WATER AND | UNDISTURBED O [7p)
TAMP TO REMOVE AIR SUBRADE Q —
POCKETS. 8 S
SHRUB AREAS CODE  QTY BOTANICAL NAME COMMON NAME CONT  HT SPACING  REMARKS 75 (O]
PLANT PIT DETAIL o
J "4', 4:.'<17 . . PR I N . " m
% JD 40 Juniperus chinensis "Parsonii Parson’s Juniper 3 gal 30" o.c. 2 TYPlCAL PLANT SPAC'NG 3 TREE PLANT'NG _ GUY STRAP ]
T NOT TO SCALE 329399-04 1" = 1'=0" 329343.26—02 <
AN MS 29 Miscanthus sinensis "Adagio’ Adagio Miscanthus Grass 3 gal 42" o.c. NOTE:
o STAKE TO FIRST BRANCHES AS
NECESSARY FOR FIRM SUPPORT
e WIRE SHALL NOT TOUCH OR RUB
SOD/SEED CODE QTY BOTANICAL NAME COMMON NAME CONT SPACING REMARKS ADJACENT TRUNKS OR BRANCHES
. ] , 2 STRAND 12 GAUGE
SOD 28,062 sf Cynodon dactylon "Tifway 419 Tifway 419 Bermuda Grass sod GALY. WIRE TWISTED AND
ENCASED IN RUBBER
HOSE 6—9” FROM TOP OF g p
/' STAKE. 2 WIRE ° > PLANT SPACING PER
SUPPORTS SHALL BE S e ocee i PLAN/PLANT SCHEDULE
USED ON MAIN (LI 5t b ) -
STRUCTURAL TRUNK. ‘%%"?‘3}}%{5"5 2” MULCH INSTALLED BEFORE Revisions
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RO
TO BACKFILLING. N PREPARE BED PER SPECS
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IEIIEIH ==
=Ty SPECIFIED PLANTING MIX. Registration
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Drawn
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4 Checked
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GENERAL CONDITIONS PLANT MATERIAL AND PLANTING D 1 DI~
CROWN MULCH NEAR o CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR THE SITE INSPECTION PRIOR TO o PLANT QUANTITIES ARE OFFERED AS A CONVENIENCE TO THE CONTRACTOR, Project No.
EDGE IN A BERM—LIKE LANDSCAPE CONSTRUCTION AND INSTALLATION IN ORDER TO ACQUAINT HIMSELF AND ARE NOT ABSOLUTE. CONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY PLANT COUNT FROM 02.27.17
MULCH LAYER MANNER AS SHOWN WITH EXISTING CONDITIONS. CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOCATING PLAN AND REPORT DIFFERENCES. Dote
ALL EXISTING UNDERGROUND UTILITIES BEFORE BEGINNING CONSTRUCTION. e ALL PLANT MATERIALS ARE SUBJECT TO APPROVAL OR REFUSAL BY THE
PREPARED e CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR PROTECTION OF LANDSCAPE MATERIAL AT ALL OWNER OR LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT AT THE JOB SITE.
SUBGRADE — TIMES. LANDSCAPE CONTRACTOR TO COORDINATE SAFE STAGING AREA WITH e PLANTS SHALL BE WELL FORMED, VIGOROUS, GROWING SPECIMENS WITH
LAWN GENERAL CONTRACTOR AND/OR OWNER. GROWTH TYPICAL OF VARIETIES SPECIFIED AND SHALL BE FREE FROM
10" e CONTRACTOR SHALL GUARANTEE ALL PLANT MATERIAL, INCLUDING GRASS, FOR 365 INJURY, INSECTS AND DISEASES. PLANTS SHALL EQUAL OR SURPASS Sheet Title
CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS FROM SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION OF THE WORK, AS QUALITY AS DEFINED IN THE CURRENT ISSUE OF "AMERICAN STANDARDS
DETERMINED BY THE PROJECT LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT. FOR NURSERY STOCK” AS PUBLISHED BY THE AMERICAN NURSERYMEN, INC.
) e ALL AREAS IMPACTED NEGATIVELY BY CONSTRUCTION PROCESSES SHALL BE o UNLESS NOTED SPECIFICALLY, ALL PLANT MATERIAL SHALL BE BALLED AND
2 3 RETURNED TO ORIGINAL CONDITION OR BETTER PRIOR TO SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION. BURLAPPED OR CONTAINER GROWN.
- g LANDSCAPE AREA SOIL PREPARATION « FRONT ROW OF SHRUBS SHALL BE PLANTED FROM CENTER OF PLANT A
o R O O SO M T p MMM O B BEANOBED LNE © LA OF WALKS A0 A M
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—| == E=IEIEEI SHALL BE APPROVED BY LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT PRIOR TO PURCHASE. COMPOST  , NO PRUNING SHOULD BE PERFORMED DURING FIRST GROWING SEASON
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PROPER FUNCTION OF DRAINAGE SYSTEMS. e ONE YEAR OF LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FROM SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION
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CITY OF y
GULFA/ SHORES CMALL TOWN, 816 BEACH

f

ALABAMA

TO: Mayor Craft & Members of the City Council
FROM: Noel Hand, Public Works Director
SUBJECT: Heavy Equipment Rental Bid

DATE: June 10, 2020

RECOMMENDATION: Award bid for Heavy Equipment Rental to 1 Source Power &
Equipment, Herc Rentals, Robertsdale RentAll, Sunbelt, Beard Equipment, United Rentals,
and Ahern; based upon the lowest daily, weekly, and monthly rental rate and availability. The
term of the rental agreement shall be one year from the date of award, with an option by the
City to renew each year for two additional years.

BACKGROUND: Bids were opened on June 3, 2020. After reviewing the submitted bids,
several vendors have the lowest bid depending upon availability and size of equipment. The
award will be based on the vendor with the lowest price and availability at the time of need.

PREVIOUS COUNCIL ACTION: This is an annual heavy equipment rental bid that comes
to council each year. Council has awarded this bid to multiple vendors in years previous.

BUDGET IMPLICATIONS: This rental contract would be available for any City
department’s use. Funding for Public Works is provided for in the 2020 operating budget of
$15,000.00 in Account #01-563-64421, Equipment Rental.

RELATED ISSUES: None

ATTACHMENTS:
e Bid Tabulation

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

STAFF CONTACT: Noel Hand

Post Office Box 299
Gulf Shores, AL 36547



2020-0603 Heavy Equipment Rental - Unit Price Bid Tabulation

Vendor 1 Source Power & Equipment Herc Rentals Robertsdale Rentall SUNBELT Beard Equipment United Rentals Ahern
COUTYy CTOZICT ZO T ZOJ OZT T DOrT IVITOOUCTTOTT, U ZO XL I f T ZIU T OCPTTaNTC aroUTTIC OUU-OU0 T OZ yTrTT ICTOS ZO 170U 2000 MOSSTITOCTINy ZO0 T IO IFIU
Contact sfgfggggi:éifgﬁf;l?l;: cory.crozier@hercrentals.com dan@baldwintractor.com contractteam@sunbeltentals.com rfields@beadequipment.com jsummers2@ur.com Kevin O'Sullivan 850-517-8270
Equipment
Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer
Minimum HP Blade Width Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
80 hp 123.91n. NO BID NO BID $1,500 $3,765 NO BID NO BID $1,325 $2,950 $1,375 $4,100 $1,278 $3,198 NO BID NO BID
99 hp 128.11in. $1,600 $3,610 $1,685 $4,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,900 $5,400 $1,402 $3,898 NO BID NO BID
145 hp 10.46 ft. NO BID NO BID $3,075 $7,875 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,350 $6,950 $2,498 $6,198 NO BID NO BID
Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader
Minimum HP Bucket Capacity Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
129 hp 2.2yd3 $1,550 $3,400 $1,650 $4,600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,200 $3,600 $1,478 $3,858 NO BID NO BID
143 hp 3.0 yd3 $1,690 $3,750 $1,650 $4,600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,700 $5,100 $1,598 $4,358 NO BID NO BID
180 hp 3.0-4.0 yd3 $1,850 $4,625 $1,850 $4,850 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,250 $6,700 $1,698 $4,658 $2,100 $4,900
Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders
Minimum Hp Tipping Load Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
49 hp 2800 lbs. NO BID NO BID $465 $1,125 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $658 $1,398 NO BID NO BID
57 hp 4000 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $465 $1,125 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $725 $1,508 NO BID NO BID
78 hp 5400 lbs. NO BID NO BID $695 $1,450 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $750 $1,698 NO BID NO BID
Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders
Minimum Hp Tipping Load Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
49 hp 2800 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $755 $1,900 NO BID NO BID $945 $2,195 NO BID NO BID $750 $1,458 $995 $1,975
57 hp 4000 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $755 $1,900 $1,000 $1,800 $1,095 $2,550 $1,000 $2,975 $798 $1,598 NO BID NO BID
78 hp 5400 Ibs. $1,000 $1,930 $755 $1,900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,200 $3,300 $878 $1,728 NO BID NO BID
90 hp w/cab $1,330 $2,100 $825 $2,035 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,300 $3,925 $948 $2,398 NO BID NO BID
High Flow & Bush Hog Attachment NO BID NO BID $527 $1,254 NO BID NO BID $295 $895 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tracked Excavato

I'S

Tracked Excavators

Tracked Excavators

Tracked Excavators

Tracked Excavators

Tracked Excavators

Tracked Excavators

Tracked Excavators

Minimum HP Operating Weight Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly

30 hp 7575 Ibs. $750 $1,450 $705 $1,480 $1,040 $2,200 $695 $1,490 $850 $2,550 $678 $1,428 $905 $2,225

79 hp 26410 lbs. NO BID NO BID $1,520 $4,020 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,800 $5,400 $1,248 $3,108 NO BID NO BID

90 hp 32590 Ibs. $1,550 $3,400 $1,520 $4,020 NO BID NO BID $1,575 $3,895 $1,800 $5,400 $1,449 $3,298 $1,675 $3,900

125 hp 43320 Ibs. $1,750 $3,850 $1,960 $5,125 NO BID NO BID $1,975 $4,975 $2,000 $5,900 $1,569 $4,258 NO BID NO BID

138 hp 50700 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $2,520 $6,375 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,100 $6,400 $1,898 $4,798 $2,255 $4,999

188 hp 52602 Ibs. $2,400 $5,500 $3,160 $7,875 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,600 $6,800 $1,998 $5,998 NO BID NO BID

Long Reach Tracked Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators
Minimum Reach Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
60 ft. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,800 $9,500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $900 $4,250 $12,800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 ft. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
100 ft. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt
Minimum HP Operating Weight Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly

22 hp 3308 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $495 $1,180 NO BID NO BID $415 $1,050 NO BID NO BID $628 $1,298 $950 $2,100

32.7 hp 5400 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $615 $1,575 NO BID NO BID $510 $1,550 $750 $2,275 $728 $1,598 $1,150 $2,400

46 hp 8688 Ibs. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,100 $3,300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil
Minimum HP Operating Weight Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly

83 hp 10190 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $1,090 $2,485 NO BID NO BID $875 $1,995 $925 $2,850 $978 $1,298 NO BID NO BID

100 hp 15750 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $1,340 $2,940 NO BID NO BID $1,095 $2,275 $1,200 $3,600 $728 $1,598 $1,690 $3,550

130 hp 24960 Ibs. NO BID NO BID $1,640 $3,900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,500 $4,500 $1,178 $2,498 NO BID NO BID

150 hp 25479 Ibs. NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,500 $4,500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts

Minimum Hight |Max Lifting Weight Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
15 ft. 500 Ibs. NO BID NO BID NO BID $100 $195 $370 NO BID NO BID NO BID $125 $175 $350 NO BID NO BID NO BID $108 $208 $348 $125 $235 $395
25 ft. 500 Ibs. $325 $400 $650 $135 $260 $525 NO BID NO BID NO BID $155 $275 $495 NO BID NO BID NO BID $145 $278 $468 $175 $285 $525
33 ft. 1500 Ibs. $360 $475 $750 $160 $355 $725 NO BID NO BID NO BID $200 $395 $610 NO BID NO BID NO BID $183 $368 $598 $220 $448 $795
Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts

Reach Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
40 ft. $625 $785 $1,700 $305 $645 $1,575 NO BID NO BID NO BID $295 $690 $1,425 NO BID NO BID NO BID $325 $648 $1,498 $335 $725 $1,650
60 ft. $600 $1,000 $2,000 $380 $875 $2,200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $395 $905 $1,725 NO BID NO BID NO BID $408 $798 $1,798 $435 $999 $2,550
Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers

Trenching Depth [Trenching Width Daily | Weekly | Monthly Daily | Weekly | Monthly Daily | Weekly | Monthly Daily | Weekly | Monthly Daily | Weekly | Monthly Daily | Weekly | Monthly Daily | Weekly | Monthly




Vendor 1 Source Power & Equipment Herc Rentals Robertsdale Rentall SUNBELT Beard Equipment United Rentals Ahern
48.in. 8in. NO BID NO BID NO BID $383 $960 $2,170 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $298 $578 $1,398 NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 in. gin. NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $318 $798 $1,508 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors
Minimum HP CFM (self-entry) Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
185 $375 $500 $1,000 $115 $220 $565 NO BID NO BID NO BID $110 $350 $550 NO BID NO BID NO BID $130 $288 $478 $150 $449 $775
375** $425 $800 $1,600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $195 $610 $1,325 NO BID NO BID NO BID $228 $518 $978 $190 $649 $1,350
750%* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4X4 Diesel Utility Vehicle (Gator, Mule or equivalent) 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle
Minimum HP Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
2 Seater*** $108 $208 $398
4 Seater*** $128 $258 $498
18 hp NO BID NO BID NO BID $155 $360 $850 NO BID NO BID NO BID $100 $195 $350 NO BID NO BID NO BID $150 $360 $695
Street Sweeper with Broom and Cab Street Sweeper Street Sweeper Street Sweeper Street Sweeper Street Sweeper Street Sweeper
Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
8" Broom*** $341 $878 $2,098 $300 $795 $1,995
NO BID NO BID NO BID $279 $664 $1,515 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $400 $1,200 $3,600 - - -
Telehandler Forklift Telhandler Telhandler Telhandler Telhandler Telhandler Telhandler
5000-14,000 Ibs. Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $258 $658 $1,498 $325 $990 $1,699
5500 NO BID NO BID NO BID $295 $770 $1,730 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0 $0 $0
6000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $360 $850 $1,950 NO BID NO BID NO BID $295 $850 $1,625 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $375 $1,036 $1,999
8000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $390 $1,045 $2,295 NO BID NO BID NO BID $395 $950 $1,820 NO BID NO BID NO BID $298 $698 $1,498 $425 $1,150 $2,300
10,000 $750 $1,750 $3,000 $495 $1,385 $3,250 NO BID NO BID NO BID $495 $1,105 $2,850 NO BID NO BID NO BID $498 $1,398 $2,898 $525 $1,395 $3,333
12,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $625 $1,995 $4,225 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $625 $1,596 $3,789
15,000 $702 $1,998 $5,028 $0 $0 $0
Rotary Foresty Mulcher Attachment Rotary Forestry Mulcher Attachement | Rotary Forestry Mulcher Attachement | Rotary Forestry Mulcher Attachement | Rotary Forestry Mulcher Attachement | Rotary Forestry Mulcher Attachement | Rotary Forestry Mulcher Attachement
Drum Style Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel Driven Pump Diesel Driven Pump Diesel Driven Pump Diesel Driven Pump Diesel Driven Pump Diesel Driven Pump Diesel Driven Pump
w/t 6" hoses Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $258 $698 $1,458 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Motorizied Tracked Concrete Buggy Concrete Bugg Concrete Bugg Concrete Bugg Concrete Bugg Concrete Bugg Concrete Bugg
1.5-1.9 Cubic Yards Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
[ NO BID NO BID NO BID $167 $592 $1,249 $175 $750 $1,500 $90 $275 $695 NO BID NO BID NO BID $148 $508 $918 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Delivery & Pickup Fee Included in Rates $100 Each Way N/A $125 N/A $78 Each Way $125 EACH WAY OR $250.00 ROUNDTRIP

(PER TRUCKLOAD)




CITY OF y
GULF ({/ SHORES AL TOWN, 516 BEACH

f

TO: Mayor Craft & Members of the City Council

FROM: Andy Bauer, Zoning Administrator

SUBJECT: Bicycle and Pedestrian Advisory Committee Appointments

DATE: June 15, 2020

RECOMMENDATION: Appoint Kerry Dey and a designee of the Police Department, Josh
Coleman, to the Bicycle and Pedestrian Advisory Committee. The Bicycle and Pedestrian
Advisory Committee members serve 4 year terms.

Kerry Dey is an elementary school teacher and will replace Frank Malone and Josh Coleman is
the current Police Department Community Service Officer and will replace Josh Hoguet who
was re-assigned to patrol duty.

BACKGROUND: In 2017 the City Council approved the formation of an 8 member Bicycle

Pedestrian Advisory Committee. The committee meets a minimum of every quarter to discuss
City projects and members provide valuable input on the City’s bicycle and pedestrian facilities.

ATTACHMENTS: No Attachments
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