2016-0420 Heavy Equipment Rental - Unit Price Bid Tabulation

Vendor 1Source Baldwin Rentals (Robertsdale Rent-All) Beard Cowin Sunbelt United Rentals
Phillip Sirmon, 251-525-0938, Dan Middleton, Jr., 251-947-4567, Ryan Fields, 251-604-2838, Will Woodson, 251-633-4020, Stephanie Ransone, 800-508-4762, Andrew Bax, 877-874-4468,
Contact phillip.sirmon@1sourcellc.com angie@baldwintractor.com rfields@beardequipment.com wwoodson@cowin.com contactteam@sunbeltrentals.com govrents@ur.com
Equipment
Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer Tracked Crawler Dozer
Minimum HP Blade Width Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
80 hp 123.9in. $1,100 $2,750 No Bid No Bid $1,550 $4,100 $2,140 $4,900 $1,782.09 $4,241.40 $1,472.58 $3,496.75
99 hp 128.1in. $1,250 $3,000 No Bid No Bid $1,650 $4,250 $2,260 $5,200 No Bid No Bid $1,669.58 $3,989.25
145 hp 10.46 ft. $3,500 $8,000 No Bid No Bid $2,950 $7,750 $3,460 $8,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader Wheeled Front End Loader
Minimum HP Bucket Capacity Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
129 hp 2.2 yd3 $1,475 $3,500 No Bid No Bid $1,650 $4,500 $2,140 $4,900 No Bid No Bid $1,526.75 $4,132.08
143 hp 3.0yd3 $1,475 $3,500 No Bid No Bid $1,650 $4,500 $2,700 $6,300 No Bid No Bid $1,684.63 $4,427.58
180 hp 3.0-4.0yd3 $2,400 $7,200 No Bid No Bid $2,250 $5,550 $3,180 $7,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loaders Wheeled Skid Steer Loader
Minimum Hp Tipping Load Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
49 hp 2800 Ibs. $500 $1,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,066.94 $2,800.80 $576.23 $1,275.58
57 hp 4000 lbs. $550 $1,390 No Bid No Bid $750 $2,100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $625.48 $1,354.38
78 hp 5400 Ibs. $600 $1,450 No Bid No Bid $750 $2,450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders Tracked Skid Steer Loaders
Minimum Hp Tipping Load Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
49 hp 2800 Ibs. S775 $1,400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,066.94 $2,800.80 $837.25 $1,846.88
57 hp 4000 lbs. S775 $1,400 No Bid No Bid $850 $1,950 $1,300 $2,800 No Bid No Bid $837.25 $1,846.88
78 hp 5400 Ibs. S775 $1,400 No Bid No Bid $850 $1,950 $1,380 $3,000 No Bid No Bid $837.25 $1,846.88
Alternate: 75 hp [6570 Ibs. $825 $1,925
Tracked Excavators Tracked Excavators Tracked Excavators Tracked Excavators Tracked Excavators Tracked Excavators Tracked Excavators
Minimum HP Operating Weight Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
30 hp 7575 lbs. $500 $1,130 $1,085 $3,185 $700 $1,800 $1,180 $2,500 $809.69 $1,566.00 $723.98 $1,699.13
79 hp 26410 lbs. $1,200 $3,000 No Bid No Bid $1,750 $4,500 $2,100 $4,800 $1,687.18 $3,903.75 $1,625.25 $3,850.00
90 hp 32590 lbs. $1,200 $3,000 No Bid No Bid $1,750 $4,500 $2,300 $5,300 No Bid No Bid $1,723.25 $4,186.25
125 hp 43320 lbs. $1,350 $3,900 No Bid No Bid $2,000 $5,200 $2,660 $6,200 $2,352.14 $5,064.60 $2,063.58 $4,998.88
138 hp 50700 lbs. $1,500 $4,500 No Bid No Bid $2,100 $5,500 $2,860 $6,700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
188 hp 52602 lbs. $2,500 $6,800 No Bid No Bid $2,500 $6,750 $2,860 $6,700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Long Reach Tracked Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators Long Reach Excavators
Minimum Reach Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
60 ft. No Bid $2,800 $7,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid $900 $4,200 $10,500 No Bid $4,500 $10,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory - Asphalt Compactor Vibratory- Asphalt
Minimum HP Operating Weight Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
22 hp 3308 Ibs. $685 $1,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $588.45 $1,205.85 $576.23 $1,403.63
32.7 hp 5400 lbs. $850 $2,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,140 $2,400 $717.43 $1,385.93 $763.38 $1,866.58
46 hp 8688 Ibs. $975 $2,600 No Bid No Bid $1,100 $2,700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory - Soil Compactor Vibratory- Soil
Minimum HP Operating Weight Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly Weekly Monthly
83 hp 10190 Ibs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $950 $1,800 $1,480 $3,250 No Bid No Bid $1,076.13 $2,687.51
100 hp 15750 Ibs. $850 $2,500 No Bid No Bid $1,175 $2,500 $1,740 $3,900 No Bid No Bid $1,194.45 $2,980.49
130 hp 24960 lbs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,475 $3,700 $1,980 $4,500 No Bid No Bid $1,617.02 $3,900.00
150 hp 25479 lbs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,475 $3,700 $1,980 $4,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissor Lifts Scissors Lifts
Minimum Hight |Max Lifting Weight Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
15 ft. 500 lIbs. $115 $240 $535 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $146.90 $305.48 $439.00 $145.78 $200.00 $369.00




Vendor 1Source Baldwin Rentals (Robertsdale Rent-All) Beard Cowin Sunbelt United Rentals
25 ft. 500 lIbs. $115 $240 $535 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $188.50 $377.51 $588.45 $172.38 $320.13 $625.48
33 ft. 1500 lbs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $254.47 $459.83 $845.70 $196.02 $458.03 $845.13
Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts Man Lifts
Reach Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
40 ft. $195 $550 $1,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $336.35 $814.83 $1,566.00 $285.65 $714.13 $1,633.92
60 ft. $275 S775 $1,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,300 $2,800 $606.61 $1,159.55 $2,075.36 $389.08 $980.08 $2,250.00
Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers Trenchers
Trenching Depth [Trenching Width Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
48 in. 8in. $250 $900 $2,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $356.95 $794.25 $1,877.60 $304.25 $852.03 $1,994.63
60 in. 8in. $300 $1,025 $3,100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $390.00 $875.36 $2,021.40 $304.25 $852.03 $1,994.63
Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors Towable Air Compressors
Minimum HP CFM (self-entry) Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
49 hp 185 $103.43 $261.03 $625.48
65 hp 185 $95 $260 $490 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $310 $560 $950 $168.10 $669.90 $558.10
123 hp 375 $150 $430 $900 $560 $980 $2,000 $256.50 $776.50 $1,587.70
4X4 Diesel Utility Vehicle (Gator, Mule or equivalent) 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4X4 Diesel Uility Vehicle 4x4 Diesel Utility Vehicle
Minimum HP Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
18 hp S53 $158 S475 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.40 $369.13 $565.92 $123.13 $290.58 $517.13
Street Sweeper with Broom and Cab Street Sweepe Street Sweepe Street Sweepe Street Sweepe Street Sweeper
Minimum HP Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
18 hp $350 $1,250 $4,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,200 $3,250 $630 $1,180 $2,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $305 $905 $1,850

. . Did not use revised bid form,
Delivery & Pickup Fee $250 $300 $250 $300 $250

pricing includes delivery and pickup

RCE 4/21/2016




