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CULEAY SHORES BID TABULATION SHEET
ALABAMA
Project Name: ANNUAL ATHLETIC UNIFORMS (2016) Bid Date: 2/11/2016
Requisition No.  2016-0213 Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM
RIVERBEND ENTERPRISES SOUTHERN SANDS AMERICAN SOCCER COMPANY
SP DESIGNS MFG dba EAST BAY ENGRAVING PRINTING CO. VARSITY SPIRIT FASHIONS RIDDELL dba SCORE SPORTS
Sport Item Style and Description Qty Sizes Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Football Jersey: Augusta Dual Threat Jersey — Youth #9551, Adult #9550 YXS $20.05 No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Polyester mesh body. YS $20.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $20.56 No Bid
100% polyester dazzle sleeves, 80% polyester/20% spandex inserts ™ 52005 526.15 530.00 NoBid 520.56 No Bid
YL $20.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $20.56 No Bid
V-neck collar YXL $20.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $20.56 No Bid
Contrast color shoulder and side inserts 180 Y2XL $20.05 No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Moisture management performance fabric AS $21.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $21.95 No Bid
Solid color jersey in Navy or White AM $21.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $21.95 No Bid
Two-tone printing: 8" numbers on front and back. AL $21.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $21.95 No Bid
2" letters on front for the logo "GS" AXL $21.05 $26.15 $30.00 No Bid $21.95 No Bid
A2XL $21.90 $27.15 $30.00 No Bid $23.11 No Bid
Pants: Augusta Gridiron Integrated - Youth #9601, Adult #9600 YXS $18.83 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $19.24 No Bid
100% polyester double knit YS $18.83 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $19.24 No Bid
5 panel construction YM $18.83 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $19.24 No Bid
7 sewn in EVA pads YL $18.83 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $19.24 No Bid
Full length self-fabric belt with D ring closure YXL $18.83 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $19.24 No Bid
No fly front 180 Y2XL $18.83 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $21.24 No Bid
White game pants AS $21.44 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $21.90 No Bid
AM $21.44 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $21.90 No Bid
AL $21.44 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $21.90 No Bid
AXL $21.44 $19.45 $20.00 No Bid $21.90 No Bid
A2XL $22.34 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid $23.16 No Bid
Socks: Augusta - Youth #6021, Intermediate #6020, Adult #6025 Youth $3.29 $4.10 $4.00 No Bid $3.29 $3.42
91% Nylong/5% Polyester/4% Elastic Tube Sock 180 Intermediate $3.36 $4.10 $4.00 No Bid $3.36 $3.42
Color Navy Adult $3.63 $4.10 $4.00 No Bid $3.57 $3.42
Coach Shirt: Augusta Avail Sport Shirt #5021 AS $19.90 $21.40 $22.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
Navy or White AM $19.90 $21.40 $22.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
100% polyester wicking closed hole mesh, 3 button 30 AL $19.90 $21.40 $22.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
2" x 2.5" GS logo on left front chest (White) AXL $19.90 $21.40 $22.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
"Football" underneath GS logo (Navy or White) A2XL $20.80 $22.90 $22.00 No Bid No Bid $20.15
"Football" Subtotal: $558.16 $572.50 $672.00 $0.00 $431.57 $103.01
Some sizes unavailable
Cheerleading Shell: Augusta, Cheerflex Shell - Youth #9201, Adult #9200 | | YXS $28.95 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $21.63 No Bid
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90% polyester/10% spandex knit YS $28.95 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $21.63 No Bid
95% nylon/5% spandex silver metallic insert YM $28.95 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $21.63 No Bid
One color shell with contrasting white chest panel YL $28.95 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $21.63 No Bid
Navy or White YXL $28.95 No Bid $24.00 $81.00 No Bid No Bid
GS logo sim stitch on front (two color) 50 Y2XL $28.95 No Bid $24.00 $81.00 No Bid No Bid
AS $29.90 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $22.89 No Bid
AM $29.90 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $22.89 No Bid
AL $29.90 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $22.89 No Bid
AXL $29.90 $23.80 $24.00 $81.00 $22.89 No Bid
A2XL $30.80 $24.80 $24.00 $81.00 $24.22 No Bid
Skirt: Augusta, Cheerflex Skirt - Youth #9206, Adult #9205 YXS $13.36 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $13.65 No Bid
90% polyester/10% spandex knit YS $13.36 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $13.65 No Bid
95% nylon/5% spandex silver metallic insert YM $13.36 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $13.65 No Bid
Covered elastic waistband YL $13.36 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $13.65 No Bid
Navy or White YXL $13.36 No Bid $15.00 Included in Set No Bid No Bid
Two-color triangular inserts on side 50 Y2XL $13.36 No Bid $15.00 Included in Set No Bid No Bid
AS $14.66 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $14.98 No Bid
AM $14.66 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $14.98 No Bid
AL $14.66 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $14.98 No Bid
AXL $14.66 $15.95 $15.00 Included in Set $14.98 No Bid
A2XL $15.89 $16.95 $15.00 Included in Set $16.24 No Bid
Brief/Bloomer: Augusta - #9016 Youth, #9015 Adult YXS $4.66 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $4.76 No Bid
100% polyester wicking smooth knit YS $4.66 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $4.76 No Bid
YM $4.66 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $4.76 No Bid

Double needle hemmed covered elastic waistband and leg opening
YL $4.66 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $4.76 No Bid
Colors Navy and/or Columbia Blue YXL $4.66 No Bid $6.00 Included in Set No Bid No Bid
50 Y2XL $4.66 No Bid $6.00 Included in Set No Bid No Bid
AS $5.20 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $5.32 No Bid
AM $5.20 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $5.32 No Bid
AL $5.20 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $5.32 No Bid
AXL $5.20 $6.30 $6.00 Included in Set $5.32 No Bid
A2XL $5.48 $7.30 $6.00 Included in Set $5.60 No Bid
Pom Poms: GTM Sportswear Metallic Poms #PPMET Youth $13.70 $18.85 $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

One color plastic pom, baton handle
50 pairs

1,000 streamers per pom, streamer %” wide

Color White, Navy, and/or Columbia Blue
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Coach Shirt: Augusta Avail Sport Shirt #5021 AS $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
Navy AM $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
100% polyester wicking closed hole mesh, 3 button 12 AL $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
2" x 2.5" GS logo on left front chest (White) AXL $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15
"Cheerleading" underneath the GS logo (White) A2XL $20.80 $22.90 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $20.15
"Cheerleading Football" Subtotal: $647.13 $544.80 $647.00 $891.00 $378.98 $92.75

Some sizes unavailable

Basketball Boys and Coed Jersey: Augusta Reversible Wicking Tank YXS $11.35 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
Youth #149, Adult #148 YS $11.35 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
Two layers of 100% polyester wicking knit YM $11.35 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
Reversible jersey, color to white or other reversible color YL $11.35 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
NBA team logos printed on both sides YXL $11.35 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
4" numbers on front and 6" numbers on back of the jersey, color 170 Y2XL $11.35 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
side and reversible white side As $11.80 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
AM $11.80 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
AL $11.80 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
AXL $11.80 $19.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $12.69
A2XL $12.75 $20.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $14.69
Boys and Coed Shorts: Augusta Training Short YXS $4.11 No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid $8.75
Youth #1421, Adult #1420 YS $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
100% polyester wicking knit YM $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
Waist with drawcord YL $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
9" inseam YXL $4.11 No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid $8.75
170 Y2XL $4.11 No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid $8.75
AS $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
AM $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
AL $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
AXL $4.11 $7.55 $8.00 No Bid $4.20 $8.75
A2XL $5.82 $8.55 $8.00 No Bid $5.94 $10.75
Girls Jersey: Augusta Winning Streak - Youth #1183, Adult #1182 YXS $10.75 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100% polyester wicking knit YS $10.75 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $15.40 No Bid
V-neck collar YM $10.75 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $15.40 No Bid
Contrast color stripes on side YL $10.75 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $15.40 No Bid
Racerback styling YXL $10.75 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" numbers on the front, 6" numbers on the back 90 Y2XL $10.75 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11" x 9" logo on the front, "City of Gulf Shores" "Basketball" AS $11.60 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $16.66 No Bid
AM $11.60 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $16.66 No Bid
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AL $11.60 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $16.66 No Bid
AXL $11.60 $19.40 $20.00 No Bid $16.66 No Bid
A2XL $12.75 $20.40 $20.00 No Bid $17.15 No Bid
Girls Shorts: Augusta Winning Streak — Youth #1186, Adult #1185 YXS $11.37 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $11.62 No Bid
100% polyester wicking knit YS $11.37 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $11.62 No Bid
Covered elastic waistband with drawcord YM $11.37 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $11.62 No Bid
Contrast color stripes on side YL $11.37 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $11.62 No Bid
9" inseam, youth inseam graded YXL $11.37 No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 Y2XL $11.37 No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AS $12.67 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $12.95 No Bid
AM $12.67 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $12.95 No Bid
AL $12.67 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $12.95 No Bid
AXL $12.67 $12.15 $13.00 No Bid $12.95 No Bid
A2XL $14.32 $13.15 $13.00 No Bid $14.63 No Bid
Coach Shirt: Augusta Winning Streak #5091 AS $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
Variety of colors AM $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
100% polyester wicking closed hole mesh, 3 button 80 AL $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
2" x 2.5" GS logo on left front chest (Navy or White) AXL $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
"Basketball" underneath the GS logo (Navy or White) A2XL $21.75 $23.85 $28.00 No Bid $23.85 $20.15
"Basketball" Subtotal: $536.79 $602.20 $811.00 $0.00 $392.17 $332.59

Some sizes unavailable

Baseball Jersey: Augusta Power Plus - Youth #429, Adult #428 YXS $22.80 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
Youth 100% polyester wicking knit YS $22.80 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.34 $15.85
100% polyester mesh inserts YM $22.80 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.34 $15.85
Raglan sleeves with contrast color inserts YL $22.80 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.34 $15.85
Two button YXL $22.80 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
Up to 10” x 10” custom one color screen on front 335 Y2XL $22.80 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
6” numbers on back AS $23.25 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.97 $15.85
AM $23.25 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.97 $15.85
AL $23.25 $17.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.97 $15.85
AXL $23.25 $18.95 $20.00 No Bid $14.97 $15.85
A2XL $24.85 $13.95 $20.00 No Bid $17.14 $17.85
Pants: Augusta - Youth #1441, Adult #1440 YXS $12.40 $13.95 $14.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
Grey YS $12.40 $13.95 $14.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
100% polyester doubleknit material YM $12.40 $13.95 $14.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
Ankle length and open bottom YL $12.40 $13.95 $14.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
Tunnel belt loop YXL $12.40 $13.95 $14.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
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Metal fly front with two button snaps 335 Y2XL $12.40 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid $13.95
Two set-in back pockets AS $15.21 $16.40 $14.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
AM $15.21 $16.40 $14.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
AL $15.21 $16.40 $14.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
AXL $15.21 $16.40 $14.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
A2XL $18.35 $17.90 $14.00 No Bid $18.76 $15.95
Hats: Augusta FlexFit Vapor Cap - Youth #6301, Adult #6300 Youth $8.95 $12.45 $14.00 No Bid $13.28 No Bid
All color options 225 Adult $8.95 $12.45 $14.00 No Bid $13.28 No Bid
One color “GS” embroidered
Hats: Augusta Adjustable Wicking Mesh Cap - Y #6271, A #6270 Youth $6.35 $9.85 $8.00 No Bid $9.60 No Bid
All color options 125 Adult $6.35 $9.85 $8.00 No Bid $9.60 No Bid
One color “GS” embroidered
Belts: Augusta - Youth #6002, Adult #6001 One Size Fits All $4.80 $4.55 $6.00 No Bid $4.41 $3.95
Elastic baseball/softball belt, matching leather tabs $4.69
Nickel plated buckle, 1.5" width belt 335
Full adjustable belt, one size fits all 22"- 46" waist
Socks: Augusta - Youth #6027, Intermediate #6026, Adult #6028 T-Ball $3.75 $4.05 $5.00 No Bid $3.71 $2.95
All sport one color sock 335 Youth $3.80 $4.05 $5.00 No Bid $3.92 $2.95
85% Acrylic, 10% Nylon, 5% Lycra Spandex Varsity/Adult $3.90 $4.05 $5.00 No Bid $4.06 $2.95
"Baseball Youth" Subtotal: $455.09 $373.10 $439.00 $0.00 $329.46 $344.60
Some sizes unavailable
Baseball Jersey: Badger Sports - Youth #2937, Adult #7937 YXS $21.65 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
Dixie Boys Navy/White, Columbia Blue/White YS $21.65 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
100% microfiber polyester jersey with moisture management YM $21.65 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
fibers, raglan sleeve YL $21.65 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
Contrasting armhole inserts and shoulder piping YXL $21.65 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
4" x 4" GS logo on left chest 40 Y2XL $21.65 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
(Navy, White, and/or Columbia Blue) AS $23.95 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
6" number on the back (Navy, White, and/or Columbia Blue) AM $23.95 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
AL $23.95 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
AXL $23.95 $20.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
A2XL $24.60 $21.85 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $17.85
Pants: Augusta - Youth #1441, Adult #1440 YXS $12.40 $13.95 $15.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
Grey YS $12.40 $13.95 $15.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
100% polyester doubleknit material YM $12.40 $13.95 $15.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
Ankle length and open bottom YL $12.40 $13.95 $15.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
Tunnel belt loop YXL $12.40 $13.95 $15.00 No Bid $12.39 $13.95
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Metal fly front with two button snaps 40 Y2XL $12.40 No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid $13.95
Two set-in back pockets AS $15.21 $16.40 $15.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
AM $15.21 $16.40 $15.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
AL $15.21 $16.40 $15.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
AXL $15.21 $16.40 $15.00 No Bid $15.54 $13.95
A2XL $18.35 $17.90 $15.00 No Bid $18.76 $15.95
Hats: Augusta FlexFit Zone - Youth #6311, Adult #6310 Youth $8.95 $12.45 $14.00 No Bid $13.78 No Bid
Navy/White Adult $8.95 $12.45 $14.00 No Bid $13.78 No Bid
97% polyester/3% spandex wicking stretch mesh
6 panel, low profile style crown, pre-curved bill “
Contrasting color triangular side inserts
GS logo embroidered on front
Belts: Augusta - Youth #6002, Adult #6001 One Size Fits All $4.80 $4.55 $5.00 No Bid $4.41 $3.95
Elastic baseball/softball belt, matching leather tabs $4.69
Nickel plated buckle 40
Full adjustable belt, one size fits all 22"-46" waist
1.5" width belt
Socks: Augusta - Youth #6027, Intermediate #6026, Adult #6028 T-Ball $3.77 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.71 $2.95
All sport one color sock 40 Youth $3.84 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.92 $2.95
85% Acrylic, 10% Nylon, 5% Lycra Spandex Varsity/Adult $3.97 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $4.06 $2.95
"Baseball Dixie Boys" Subtotal: $438.17 $383.50 $430.00 $0.00 $191.22 $344.60
Some sizes unavailable
Baseball Jersey: Augusta Gamer Jersey - Youth #1521, Adult #1520 YXS $23.30 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
Dixie Youth & 100% polyester wicking knit YS $23.30 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $17.25 $15.85
Boys AllStars Contrast color shoulder YM $23.30 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $17.25 $15.85
Two button YL $23.30 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $17.25 $15.85
4” x 4” GS logo on left chest YXL $23.30 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
(Navy, White, and/or Columbia Blue) 70 Y2XL $23.30 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $15.85
6” number on the back AS $24.15 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $18.29 $15.85
(Navy, White, and/or Columbia Blue) AM $24.15 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $18.29 $15.85
Sim-stitched two-color AL $24.15 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $18.29 $15.85
AXL $24.15 $26.95 $20.00 No Bid $18.29 $15.85
A2XL $25.60 $27.95 $20.00 No Bid $20.26 $17.85
Pants: Augusta - Youth #1446, Adult #1445 YXS $17.05 $17.35 $18.00 No Bid $16.87 $13.95
White with navy piping YS $17.05 $17.35 $18.00 No Bid $16.87 $13.95
100% polyester doubleknit material YM $17.05 $17.35 $18.00 No Bid $16.87 $13.95
Tunnel belt loop YL $17.05 $17.35 $18.00 No Bid $16.87 $13.95
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Metal fly front with two button snaps YXL $17.05 $17.35 $18.00 No Bid $16.87 $13.95
Two set-in back pockets 70 Y2XL $17.05 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $13.95
Ankle length and open bottom AS $18.50 $18.65 $18.00 No Bid $18.34 $13.95
AM $18.50 $18.65 $18.00 No Bid $18.34 $13.95
AL $18.50 $18.65 $18.00 No Bid $18.34 $13.95
AXL $18.50 $18.65 $18.00 No Bid $18.34 $13.95
A2XL $21.64 $19.90 $18.00 No Bid $21.42 $15.95
Hats: Richardson Dryve R-Flex #PTS40S Youth $13.29 $15.85 $17.00 No Bid $11.83 No Bid
Navy Adult $15.00 $15.85 $17.00 No Bid $11.83 No Bid
Performance micro mesh, 6 panel, flat to curved bill 70
GS bumped embroidered logo (Columbia Blue or White)
Belts: Augusta - Youth #6002, Adult #6001 One Size Fits All $4.80 $4.55 $5.00 No Bid $4.41 $3.95
Elastic baseball/softball belt with matching leather tabs $4.69
Nickel plated buckle, 1.5” width belt 70
Full adjustable belt, one size fits all 22”-46" waist
Socks: Augusta - Youth #6027, Intermediate #6026, Adult #6028 T-Ball $3.77 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.71 $2.95
All sport one color sock 70 Youth $3.84 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.92 $2.95
85% Acrylic, 10% Nylon, 5% Lycra Spandex Varsity/Adult $3.97 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $4.06 $2.95
"Baseball Dixie Youth & Boys AllStars" Subtotal: $504.61 $500.15 $469.00 $0.00 $368.75 $344.60
Some sizes unavailable
Softball Jersey: Augusta Triumph - Youth #1236, Adult #1235 YXS $21.65 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $12.40
100% polyester wicking smooth knit YS $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $12.76 $12.40
Wicking duo knit inserts YM $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $12.76 $12.40
Overlapping v-neck with two color heavy rib trim YL $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $12.76 $12.40
Contrast color duo knit v-neck collar YXL $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid No Bid $12.40
Sleeveless 150 Y2XL $21.65 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $12.40
Up to 10” x 10” custom screen on front AS $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40
6” number on the back AM $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40
AL $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40
AXL $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40
A2XL $23.55 $17.95 $18.00 No Bid $15.35 $14.40
Shorts: Augusta Triumph Short - Youth #1239, Adult #1238 YXS $10.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $6.10
100% polyester wicking smooth knit YS $10.00 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $10.22 $6.10
Wicking duo knit inserts YM $10.00 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $10.22 $6.10
Drawstring waistband YL $10.00 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $10.22 $6.10
Contrast color front and back duo knit inserts YXL $10.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $6.10
5” inseam 75 Y2XL $10.00 No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $6.10




RIVERBEND ENTERPRISES

SOUTHERN SANDS

AMERICAN SOCCER COMPANY

SP DESIGNS MFG dba EAST BAY ENGRAVING PRINTING CO. VARSITY SPIRIT FASHIONS RIDDELL dba SCORE SPORTS
AS $11.60 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10
AM $11.60 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10
AL $11.60 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10
AXL $11.60 $11.80 $11.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10
A2XL $12.80 $12.80 $11.00 No Bid $13.09 $8.10
Pants: Augusta Softball/Baseball - Youth #811, Adult #801 YXS $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95
Grey YS $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95
100% polyester doubleknit material YM $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95
Tunnel belt loop YL $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95
Metal fly front with two button snaps YXL $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95
Set in back pocket 75 Y2XL $9.93 No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid $13.95
AS $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95
AM $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95
AL $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95
AXL $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95
A2XL $15.13 $17.95 $12.00 No Bid $15.47 $15.95
Visors: Augusta Wicking Mesh Edge - Youth #6276, Adult #6275 Youth $6.35 $9.85 $8.00 No Bid $9.43 No Bid
100% texture wicking fabric, 3 panels Adult $6.35 $9.85 $8.00 No Bid $9.43 No Bid
Pre-curved bill, hook and loop fastener 150
GS logo embroidered on front
Belts: Augusta - Youth #6002, Adult #6001 One Size Fits All $4.80 $4.55 $5.00 No Bid $4.41 $3.95
Elastic baseball/softball belt, matching leather tabs $4.69
Nickel plated buckle, 1.5" width belt ”
Full adjustable belt, one size fits all 22”-46" waist
Socks: Augusta - Youth #6027, Intermediate #6026, Adult #6028 T-Ball $3.76 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.71 $2.95
All sport one color sock 150 Youth $3.83 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.92 $2.95
85% Acrylic, 10% Nylon, 5% Lycra Spandex Varsity/Adult $3.97 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $4.06 $2.95
Coach Shirt: Augusta Winning Streak #5091 AS $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
100% polyester wicking closed hole mesh AM $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
3 button 45 AL $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
2" x 2.5" GS logo on left front chest (White) AXL $20.80 $22.45 $28.00 No Bid $22.52 $18.15
"Softball" underneath the GS logo (White) A2XL $21.75 $23.85 $28.00 No Bid $23.85 $20.15
"Softball" Subtotal: $623.05 $554.60 $624.00 $0.00 $472.10 $468.50
Some sizes unavailable
Softball Jersey: Augusta Triumph - Youth #1236, Adult #1235 YXS $21.65 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $12.40
AllStars 100% polyester wicking smooth knit YS $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $12.76 $12.40
100% polyester wicking duo knit inserts YM $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $12.76 $12.40
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Contrast color duo knit v-neck collar YL $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $12.76 $12.40

Sleeveless YXL $21.65 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid No Bid $12.40

Up to 10” x 10” custom screen on front 60 Y2XL $21.65 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $12.40

6” number on the back AS $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40

AM $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40

AL $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40

AXL $22.55 $16.65 $18.00 No Bid $14.02 $12.40

A2XL $23.55 $17.95 $18.00 No Bid $15.35 $14.40

Shorts: Augusta Triumph - Youth #1239, Adult #1238 YXS $10.00 No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $6.10

100% polyester wicking smooth knit YS $10.00 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $10.22 $6.10

100% polyester wicking duo knit inserts YM $10.00 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $10.22 $6.10

Drawstring waistband YL $10.00 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $10.22 $6.10

Contrast color front and back duo knit inserts YXL $10.00 No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $6.10

5” inseam 30 Y2XL $10.00 No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $6.10

AS $11.30 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10

AM $11.30 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10

AL $11.30 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10

AXL $11.30 $11.80 $10.00 No Bid $11.55 $6.10

A2XL $12.80 $12.80 $10.00 No Bid $13.09 $6.10

Pants: Augusta Softball/Baseball - Youth #811, Adult #801 YXS $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $8.10

Grey YS $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95

100% polyester doubleknit material YM $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95

Tunnel belt loop YL $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95

Metal fly front with two button snaps YXL $9.93 $14.45 $12.00 No Bid $10.15 $13.95

Set in back pocket 30 Y2XL $9.93 No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid $13.95

AS $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95

AM $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95

AL $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95

AXL $12.87 $16.95 $12.00 No Bid $13.16 $13.95

A2XL $15.13 $17.95 $12.00 No Bid $15.47 $15.95

Visors: Augusta - Youth #6276, Adult #6275 Youth $6.35 $9.85 $9.00 No Bid $9.43 No Bid

Navy/White Adult $6.35 $9.85 $9.00 No Bid $9.43 No Bid
100% polyester textured wicking fabric -

White dazzle on side of the front panel and middle of the bill
3 panels, pre-curved bill, hook and loop fastener

GS logo embroidered on front
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Belts One Size Fits All $4.80 $4.55 $5.00 No Bid $4.41 $3.95

Navy $4.69

Elastic baseball/softball belt, matching leather tabs 30

Nickel plated buckle, 1.5” width belt

Full adjustable belt, one size fits all 22"-46" waist
Socks: Augusta - Youth #6027, Intermediate #6026, Adult #6028 T-Ball $3.76 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.71 $2.95

All sport one color sock 60 Youth $3.83 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $3.92 $2.95

85% Acrylic, 14% Nylon, 6% Lycra Spandex Varsity/Adult $3.97 $4.05 $4.00 No Bid $4.06 $2.95
Coach Shirt: Augusta Avail Sport Shirt #5021 AS $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15

Navy, 3 button AM $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15

100% polyester wicking closed hole mesh 15 AL $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15

2” x 2.5” GS logo on left front chest (White) AXL $19.90 $21.40 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $18.15

“Softball” underneath the GS logo (White) A2XL $20.80 $22.90 $28.00 No Bid No Bid $20.15

"Softball AllStars" Subtotal: $617.30 $549.45 $615.00 $0.00 $358.17 $460.65
Some sizes unavailable
GRAND TOTAL: $4,380.30 $4,080.30 $4,707.00 $891.00 $2,922.42 $2,491.30
Qualifies for Local Vendor Qualifies for Local Vendor
Preference Preference Partial Bid Partial Bid Partial Bid
(Apples-to-apples comparison) $3,846.03 $4,080.30 $4,099.00

Tabulated by R.Eberly 2/12/2016




