BID TABULATION SHEET

ALABAMA
Project Name: SEVEN (7) 2016 PICKUP TRUCKS
Requisition No. 2016-0225

Bid Date:
Bid Opening Time:

February 25, 2016
10:00 AM

Ginn Chrysler

AutoNation CDJR Landers MclLarty DCJR Moyer Ford Southern Chevrolet Stivers Ford Lincoln
Jeep Dodge
Mobile, AL Covington, GA Huntsville, AL Foley, AL Foley, AL Montgomery, AL
# |ltem Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
A |Light Duty 2WD Regular Cab Pickup Truck $23,115.00 $19,615.00 $18,187.00 $19,460.00 $28,350.00 $19,615.00
2016 RAM 1500 2016 RAM 1500 2016 RAM 1500 REG 2016 FORD F-150 XL 2016 CHEVY CC15903 2016 FORD F-150
B |Light Duty 2WD Extended Cab Pickup Truck $27,115.00 $22,698.00 $21,270.00 $22,150.00 No Bid $22,676.00
2016 RAM 1500* 2016 RAM 1500* 2016 RAM 1500 QUAD* 2016 FORD F-150 XL 2016 FORD F-150
¢ |Heavy Duty 4WD Regular Cab Pickup Truck $31,615.00 $24,688.00 $23,526.00 $24,480.00 $36,575.00 $24,430.00
2016 RAM 2500 2016 RAM 2500 2016 RAM 2500 REG 2016 FORD F-250 XL 2016 CHEVY CK25903 2016 FORD F-250
D |Heavy Duty 4WD Extended Cab Pickup Truck 535,115.00 No Bid No Bid 524,150.00 340,013.00 523,810.00
2016 RAM 2500 2016 FORD F-250 XL 2016 CHEVY CK25943 2016 FORD F-250
E |Heavy Duty 4WD Crew Cab Pickup Truck $35,115.00 $28,116.00 $26,954.00 $25,990.00 $40,536.00 $25,641.00
2016 RAM 2500 2016 RAM 2500 2016 RAM 2500 CREW 2016 FORD F-250 XL 2016 CHEVY CK25943 2016 FORD F-250
E [Light Duty 4WD Extended Cab Pickup Truck $35,115.00 $28,860.00 $25,933.00 $29,500.00 No Bid $26,710.00
2016 RAM 1500** 2016 RAM 1500 2016 RAM 1500 QUAD 2016 FORD F-150 XLT 2016 FORD F-150
G |Light Duty 4WD Crew Cab Pickup Truck $37,115.00 $29,296.00 $26,370.00 $31,500.00 No Bid $28,854.00
2016 RAM 1500 2016 RAM 1500 2016 RAM 1500 CREW 2016 FORD F-150 XLT 2016 FORD F-150
Delivery 6-8 Weeks 12-16 Weeks 65 Days 10-12 Weeks 6-8 Weeks 12-13 Weeks
Notes *8' Box unavailable *8' Box unavailable, *8' Box unavailable, Local Vendor Local Vendor
**Crew cab only 6'4" Box 6'4" Box Preference (5%) Preference (5%)
Bid Amount
$224,305.00 $153,273.00 $142,240.00 $177,230.00 $145,474.00 $171,736.00
GRAND TOTAL
IT PW/Streets | PW/Custodial | PW/Landscaping Recreation |
Iltem B x1 ltem D x2 Iltem B x1 ltem D x3 Will award 2 at a later date

Tabulated by R. Eberly 2/25/2016




