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CITY OF

ULF4¢ SHORES

ALABAMA

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:

IRRIGATION PARTS

Bid Date: January 19, 2016

Requisition No. 2016-0119 Bid Opening Time: 10:00 AM
FIS Outdoor SiteOne Landscape Supply

# |ltem Description Est. Qty. [ Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal
I. |3/4" Material
I-A |Class 200 PVC (per 20' section) 30 $2.220 $66.60 $2.360 $70.80
I-B  |Schedule 40 PVC (per 20' section) 30 $4.100 $123.00 $4.440 $133.20
I-C |Male Adapters 50 $S0.175 $8.75 $0.148 $7.40
I-D |Female Adapters 50 $0.254 $12.70 $0.215 $10.75
I-E  |Couplings 100 $S0.416 $41.60 $0.136 $13.60
I-F  |Slip Couplings 50 $S0.160 $8.00 $2.903 $145.15
I-G |Caps 10 $0.186 $1.86 $0.157 $1.57
I-H |90's 100 $0.202 $20.20 $0.169 $16.90
Il |Tees 100 $0.254 $25.40 $0.215 $21.50
I-) |45's 25 $0.455 $11.38 $0.383 $9.58
|-k |90's Threaded 100 $0.635 $63.50 $S0.221 $22.10
I-L |Tees Threaded 100 $1.268 $126.80 $0.329 $32.90
I-M [Ball Valve 50 $0.867 $43.35 $0.853 $42.65
I-N  |PVC Union 100 $1.974 $197.40 $1.671 $167.10
Il. |1" Material
[I-A |Class 200 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $2.880 $144.00 $3.080 $154.00
II-B  [Schedule 40 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $6.040 $302.00 $6.560 $328.00
[I-C |Male Adapters 300 $0.332 $99.60 $S0.271 $81.30
II-D |Female Adapters 300 $0.304 $91.20 $0.247 $74.10




II-E  [Couplings 300 $S0.565 $169.50 $0.239 $71.70
II-E  |Slip Couplings 150 $0.291 $43.65 $3.069 $460.35
II-G [Caps 20 $0.304 $6.08 $0.248 $4.96
II-H [90's 300 $0.370 $111.00 $0.302 $90.60
II-I  [Tees 300 $0.492 $147.60 $0.397 $119.10
II-J |45's 50 $0.565 $28.25 $0.460 $23.00
II-K |90's Slip x 3/4" Threaded 500 $S0.754 $377.00 $0.449 $224.50
II-L |Tees Slip x 3/4" Threaded 500 $S0.868 $434.00 $0.496 $248.00
II-M |Ball Valve 50 $2.086 $104.30 $1.124 $56.20
II-N [PVC Union 100 $2.109 $210.90 $1.723 $172.30
il. |1-1/4" Material

II-A |Class 200 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $4.820 $241.00 $4.940 $247.00
I1-B  |Schedule 40 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $9.060 $453.00 $8.720 $436.00
II-C |Male Adapters 200 $0.402 $80.40 $0.329 $65.80
II-D |Female Adapters 200 S0.472 $94.40 $0.383 $76.60
III-E  |Couplings 200 $3.540 $708.00 $0.329 $65.80
lI-F |Slip Couplings 100 $0.402 $40.20 $6.353 $635.30
-G |Caps 10 $0.432 $4.32 $0.352 $3.52
IlI-H ]90's 250 $0.654 $163.50 $0.531 $132.75
-l |Tees 250 $0.765 $191.25 $0.624 $156.00
I-J |45's 50 $0.792 $39.60 $0.643 $32.15
lI-K [Tees Slip x Slip x 3/4" Threaded 200 $1.450 $290.00 $1.183 $236.60
lI-L |Tees Slip x Slip x 1" Threaded 200 $1.450 $290.00 $1.183 $236.60
lI-M |90's Slip x 1" Threaded 200 $1.098 $219.60 $0.897 $179.40
I1-N |Ball Valve 50 $2.780 $139.00 $1.577 $78.85
-0 [PVC Union 100 $6.791 $679.10 $5.560 $556.00




II-P |Brass Gate Valve 25 $7.483 $187.08 $13.009 $325.23
I1-Q |Slip Fix 100 $4.343 $434.30 $6.353 $635.30
IV. [1-1/2" Material

IV-A |Class 200 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $5.600 $280.00 $6.560 $328.00
IV-B |Schedule 40 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $9.600 $480.00 $10.280 $514.00
IV-C |Male Adapters 200 $0.541 $108.20 $0.439 $87.80
IV-D [Female Adapters 200 $0.541 $108.20 $0.439 $87.80
IV-E [Couplings 200 $2.775 $555.00 No Bid

IV-F [Slip Couplings 100 $0.432 $43.20 $0.352 $35.20
IV-G |Caps 10 $0.472 $4.72 $0.383 $3.83
IV-H |90's 250 $0.654 $163.50 $0.572 $143.00
IV-l |Tees 250 $0.931 $232.75 $0.759 $189.75
V-] [45's 50 $0.987 $49.35 $0.807 $40.35
IV-K [Tees Slip x Slip x 3/4" Threaded 200 $1.800 $360.00 $1.471 $294.20
IV-L [Tees Slip x Slip x 1" Threaded 200 $1.800 $360.00 $1.471 $294.20
IV-M |90's Slip x 1" Threaded 200 $1.830 $366.00 $1.488 $297.60
IV-N |Ball Valve 50 $3.948 $197.40 $2.251 $112.55
IV-O [PVC Union 100 $7.076 $707.60 $5.788 $578.80
IV-P [Brass Gate Valve 25 $13.772 $344.30 $15.957 $398.93
IV-Q |Slip Fix 100 $4.672 $467.20 $6.884 $688.40
V. |2" Material

V-A [Class 200 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $9.080 $454.00 $14.480 $724.00
V-B |Schedule 40 PVC (per 20' section) 50 $12.240 $612.00 $10.400 $520.00
V-C |Male Adapters 100 $0.705 $70.50 S0.576 $57.60
V-D |Female Adapters 100 $S0.721 $72.10 $0.589 $58.90
V-E |Couplings 100 $4.524 $452.40 $0.535 $53.50




V-F |Slip Couplings 100 $0.659 $65.90 No Bid

V-G |Knock-On Couplings 30 $12.287 $368.61 $12.977 $389.31
V-H [Caps 10 $0.565 $5.65 $0.460 $4.60
V-l |90's 200 $1.098 $219.60 $0.897 $179.40
V-] |Tees 200 $1.350 $270.00 $1.109 $221.80
V-K |45's 50 $1.288 $64.40 $1.051 $52.55
V-L [Tees Slip x Slip x 3/4" Threaded 50 $2.266 $113.30 $1.849 $92.45
V-M |Tees Slip x Slip x 1" Threaded 100 $2.266 $226.60 $1.855 $185.50
V-N |90's Slip x 1" Threaded 100 $2.266 $226.60 $2.582 $258.20
V-O |Union 1 $9.540 $9.54 $31.600 $31.60
V-P |Ball Valve 50 $5.686 $284.30 $3.533 $176.65
V-Q [Brass Ball Valve 10 $20.793 $207.93 $70.467 $704.67
V-R |PVC Union 100 $9.538 $953.80 $7.812 $781.20
V-S |[Brass Gate Valve 25 $22.799 $569.98 $23.555 $588.88
V-T [Slip Fix 100 $7.115 $711.50 $10.098 | $1,009.80
VI. (3" Material

VI-A |Class 200 PVC (per 20' section) 20 $18.880 $377.60 $22.820 $456.40
VI-B |Schedule 40 PVC (per 20" section) 20 $25.240 $504.80 $27.220 $544.40
VI-C [Slip Couplings 25 $2.271 $56.78 No Bid

VI-D |Knock-On Couplings 20 $16.903 $338.06 $17.855 $357.10
VI-E [Deep Socket Couplings 50 $3.597 $179.85 $2.944 $147.20
VI-F |Caps 10 $1.965 $19.65 $1.604 $16.04
VI-G [90's 50 $4.003 $200.15 $3.277 $163.85
VI-H [Tees 50 $5.872 $293.60 $4.808 $240.40
VI-I |Ball Valve 50 $35.042 $1,752.10 $150.604 | $7,530.20
VI-J |Brass Gate Valve 25 $69.560 $1,739.00 $69.021 | $1,725.53




VI-K |Slip Fix 100 $13.458 $1,345.80 $16.870 | $1,687.00
Vil. |4" Material

VII-A |Brass Gate Valve 25 $101.673 | $2,541.83 | $101.294 | $2,532.35
VII-B |Slip Fix 100 $23.386 $2,338.60 $28.605 | $2,860.50
VIIl. |Reducer Bushings
VIII-A |3/4" Slip x 1/2" Slip 50 $0.193 $9.65 $0.157 $7.85
VIII-B |1" Slip x 3/4" Slip 500 $0.350 $175.00 $0.284 $142.00
VII-C [1" Slip x 3/4" Threaded 200 $0.492 $98.40 $0.400 $80.00
VIII-D [1-1/4" Slip x 1" Slip 300 $0.472 $141.60 $0.383 $114.90
VII-E |1-1/4" Slip x 1" Threaded 300 $0.492 $147.60 $0.615 $184.50
VIII-F [1-1/4" Slip x 3/4" Slip 200 $0.472 $94.40 $0.383 $76.60
VIII-G |1-1/4" Slip x 3/4" Threaded 100 $0.754 $75.40 $0.615 $61.50
VIII-H [1-1/2" Slip x 3/4" Slip 50 $0.497 $24.85 $0.407 $20.35
ViIl-I (1-1/2" Slip x 1" Slip 200 $0.497 $99.40 $0.407 $81.40
VIII-) [1-1/2" Slip x 1" Threaded 100 $0.868 $86.80 $0.708 $70.80
VIII-K |1-1/2" Slip x 1-1/4" Slip 300 $0.497 $149.10 $0.407 $122.10
VIII-L [2" Slip x 3/4" Slip 50 $0.819 $40.95 $0.669 $33.45
VIII-M 2" Slip x 1" Slip 200 $0.819 $163.80 $0.669 $133.80
VII-N |2" Slip x 1" Threaded 100 $1.164 $116.40 $0.951 $95.10
VIII-O |2" Slip x 1-1/4" Slip 200 $0.819 $163.80 $0.669 $133.80
VII-P |2" Slip x 1-1/2" Slip 300 $0.819 $245.70 $0.669 $200.70
VIIIl-Q |3" Slip x 1-1/2" Slip 200 $1.947 $389.40 $1.585 $317.00
VIII-R |3" Slip x 2" Slip 300 $1.947 $584.10 $1.585 $475.50

IX. |Rain Bird Irrigation Heads

IX-A |6504 Falcons 300 $22.953 $6,885.90 $23.221 | $6,966.30

IX-B |6504 High Speed Falcons 20 $59.860 $1,197.20 $23.221 $464.42




IX-C |5000 Rotors (Case with Nozzle Tree) 25 $6.116 $152.90 $118.280 | $2,957.00
IX-D |3500 Rotors (Case with Nozzle Tree) 15 $3.873 $58.10 $176.600 | $2,649.00
IX-E |1804 Mist Heads 400 $1.093 $437.20 $1.161 $464.40
IX-F |1806 Mist Heads 200 $3.895 $779.00 $4.212 $842.40
IX-G [1812 Mist Heads 400 $6.244 $2,497.60 $6.021 | $2,408.40
IX-H |5 Series MPR 100 $1.702 $170.20 $0.643 $64.30
IX-I |8 Series MPR 100 $1.702 $170.20 $0.643 $64.30
IX-J |10 Series MPR 200 $1.702 $340.40 $0.643 $128.60
IX-K |12 Series MPR 200 $1.702 $340.40 $0.643 $128.60
IX-L |15 Series MPR 300 $1.702 $510.60 $0.643 $192.90
IX-M |4 Series VAN 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-N |6 Series VAN 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-O |8 Series VAN 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-P |10 Series VAN 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-Q |12 Series VAN 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-R |15 Series VAN 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-S |12 Strip Series 100 $0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
IX-T |15 Strip Series 100 $S0.650 $65.00 $0.643 $64.30
X. [Valves, Wire, Controller Parts, etc.
X-A |1" DVF Valve 50 $12.993 $649.65 $13.782 $689.10
X-B |1-1/2" PEB Valve 50 $71.330 $3,566.50 $75.667 | $3,783.35
X-C |2" PEB Valve 100 $94.258 $9,425.80 $99.989 | $9,998.90
X-D |9 Volt Solenoid 15 $21.652 $324.78 $22.701 $340.52
X-E |24 Volt Solenoid 50 $23.868 $1,193.40 $25.112 | $1,255.60
X-F  [Red 18 Gauge Wire (per Foot) 500 $0.0433 $21.65 $0.079 $39.50
X-G |[White 18 Gauge Wire (per Foot) 500 $0.0433 $21.65 $0.079 $39.50




X-H [18-08 Multi Strand Wire (per Foot) 400 $0.263 $105.20 S0.265 $106.00
X-I |TBOS Controle Module (2 Station) 10 $126.298 | $1,262.98 | $145.010 | $1,450.10
X-J |TBOS Controle Module (4 Station) 10 $144.855 | $1,448.55 | $166.318 | $1,663.18
X-K |TBOS Controle Module (6 Station) 10 $175.268 | $1,752.68 | $201.238 | $2,012.38
X-L |TBOS Field Transmitter 2 $180.425 $360.85 $207.157 | $414.31
Xl. [Miscellaneous Parts and Tools
XI-A [Teflon Tape (per Roll) 50 $0.392 $19.60 $0.560 $28.00
XI-B |Liquid Teflon (per Can) 3 $14.750 S44.25 $8.548 $25.64
XI-C |Trenching Shovels 2 $17.790 $35.58 $15.587 $31.17
XI-D |Pipe Wrenches 2 $25.510 $51.02 $8.496 $16.99
XI-E |Plastic Pipe and Hose Cutters 2 $16.020 $32.04 $8.413 $16.83
XI-F |VP-2000 2" Ratchet Cutter 2 $98.540 $197.08 $74.667 | $149.33
XI-G [PVC Saw 2 $20.150 $40.30 $12.977 $25.95
XI-H |6" Wire Stripper/Cutter 2 $10.000 $20.00 $7.850 $15.70
XI-1 [DBY's (Case) 5 $110.750 $553.75 $113.300 $566.50
Xl-) |Wire Nuts (Case) 7 $1.540 $10.78 $95.200 $666.40
XI-K |PVC Primer (per Gallon) 5 $30.002 $150.01 $35.340 $176.70
XI-L |PVC Turf Tight Glue (per Gallon) 10 $42.272 $422.72 $39.760 $397.60
XI-M |Quick Coupling Valve 1" 2 $66.625 $133.25 $51.855 $103.71
XI-N |Quick Coupling Valve 1-1/2" 2 $71.165 $142.33 $61.101 $122.20
XI-0 |Quick Coupling Valve Key 1" 2 S47.445 $94.89 $49.428 $98.86
XI-P [Quick Coupling Valve Key 1-1/2" 2 $67.635 $135.27 $70.693 $141.39
XI-Q |SH Swivel Hose EIl 1" 2 $34.825 $69.65 $38.557 §77.11
XI-R |Falcon Nozzles 300 No Bid $0.022 $6.60
XI-S |MPR 1000 Nozzles 20 $5.038 $100.76 $4.863 $97.26
XI-T |MPR 2000 Nozzles 20 $5.038 $100.76 $4.863 $97.26




XI-U |MPR 3000 Nozzles 20 $5.038 $100.76 $4.863 $97.26
XI-V |Marlex Street Ell 1/2" 50 $0.545 $27.25 $0.105 $5.25

XI-W [Marlex Street Ell 3/4" 50 $S0.656 $32.80 $0.312 $15.60
XI-X |Marlex Street EIl 1" 100 $2.110 $211.00 $0.796 $79.60
XI-Y |1/2"x 12" Schedule 80 Nipple 50 $0.702 $35.10 $0.467 $23.35
XI-Z |3/4" x 12" Schedule 80 Nipple 50 $0.841 $42.05 $0.652 $32.60
XI-AA [1" x 12" Schedule 80 Nipple 100 $1.213 $121.30 $0.935 $93.50
XI-BB |MPT 1/2" Swing Riser 90L (Bag) 10 $0.126 $1.26 $7.750 $77.50
XI-CC |MPT 3/4" Swing Riser 90L (Bag) 10 $0.138 $1.38 $7.750 $77.50
XI-DD [Funny Pipe Tee 1/2" (Bag) 10 $0.250 $2.50 $12.550 $125.50
XI-EE [Funny Pipe Coupling (Bag) 10 $S0.212 $2.12 $9.350 $93.50
XI-FF |Threaded Cap 1/2" 20 $0.350 $7.00 S0.284 $5.68

XI-GG |Funny Pipe Roll (100') 7 $14.459 $101.21 $17.900 $125.30
XI-HH |Valve Box (6" Round) 10 $2.134 $21.34 $2.314 $23.14
XI-Il [Valve Box (10" Round) 20 $31.140 $622.80 $7.143 $142.86
XI-JJ |Valve Box (Jumbo) 10 $32.014 $320.14 $30.843 $308.43

WITHDRAWN PER
Notes BILL SEIGLE 1/20/2016
12:25 PM
GBRi:' I\':\I;"T‘_’(‘)‘:;L $70,752.08 $81,524.77

Tabulated by R. Eberly 1/20/2016




