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TRAFFIC SIGNS, PARTS & ACCESSORIES
2016-0120

Bid Date: January 19, 2016
Bid Opening Time: 10:30 AM

Vulcan Lightle Enterprises of Ohio Protection Services Trantex Transportation Centerline Supply Newman Signs
Products of Texas
# Item Description Size Color Qty.| Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal Unit Price Subtotal
A. Traffic Signs

R1-1  [STOP 30x30 25 $20.71 $517.75 $26.14 $653.50 $31.85 $796.25 $31.25 $781.25 $50.00 $1,250.00 $24.77 $619.25
R1-2  [YIELD 30x30x30 5 $11.63 $58.15 $15.64 $78.20 $17.60 $88.00 $17.95 $89.75 $62.50 $312.50 $14.14 $70.70
R1-3  [4-WAY 12x6 15 $2.19 $32.85 $2.40 $36.00 $4.80 $72.00 $4.20 $63.00 $5.50 $82.50 $5.24 $78.60
R1-3A [3-WAY 12x6 15 $2.19 $32.85 $2.40 $36.00 $4.80 $72.00 $4.20 $63.00 $5.50 $82.50 $5.24 $78.60
R1-4  [ALL WAY 18x6 15 $3.12 $46.80 $3.60 $54.00 $6.00 $90.00 $6.20 $93.00 $21.50 $322.50 $6.07 $91.05
R2-1-** |SPEED LIMIT 24x30 BLKONW [ 25 $17.05 $426.25 $23.33 $583.25 $27.25 $681.25 $27.20 $680.00 $42.50 $1,062.50 $20.53 $513.25
R3-1  [[NO RIGHT TURN] - Symbol 24x24 5 $14.02 $70.10 $18.80 $94.00 $22.10 $110.50 $23.25 $116.25 $38.00 $190.00 $17.94 $89.70
R3-5L  [[LEFT TURN] ONLY 30x36 5 $25.58 $127.90 $35.00 $175.00 $39.70 $198.50 $38.50 $192.50 $71.25 $356.25 $28.99 $144.95
R3-5R  [[RIGHT TURN] ONLY 30x36 5 $25.58 $127.90 $35.00 $175.00 $39.70 $198.50 $38.50 $192.50 $71.25 $356.25 $28.99 $144.95
R3-7L  [LEFT LANE MUST TURN LEFT 30x30 5 $21.31 $106.55 $29.17 $145.85 $33.30 $166.50 $33.40 $167.00 $59.25 $296.25 $24.77 $123.85
R3-7R  |RIGHT LANE MUST TURN RIGHT 30x30 5 $21.31 $106.55 $29.17 $145.85 $33.30 $166.50 $33.40 $167.00 $59.25 $296.25 $24.77 $123.85
R5-1  [DO NOT ENTER 30x30 10 $21.31 $213.10 $29.17 $291.70 $33.30 $333.00 $33.40 $334.00 $53.25 $532.50 $24.77 $247.70
R5-1A |WRONG WAY 30x18 5 $12.79 $63.95 $17.50 $87.50 $20.00 $100.00 $20.95 $104.75 $51.50 $257.50 $16.27 $81.35
R6-1L  [ONE WAY 36x12 10 $10.23 $102.30 $14.00 $140.00 $16.75 $167.50 $16.50 $165.00 $25.50 $255.00 $13.71 $137.10
R6-1R  [ONE WAY 36x12 10 $10.23 $102.30 $14.00 $140.00 $16.75 $167.50 $16.50 $165.00 $25.50 $255.00 $13.71 $137.10
R6-2L  [ONE WAY 18x24 5 $10.23 $51.15 $14.00 $70.00 $17.00 $85.00 $16.50 $82.50 $29.25 $146.25 $13.74 $68.70




R6-2R  [ONE WAY 18x24 5 $10.23 $51.15 $14.00 $70.00 $17.00 $85.00 $16.50 $82.50 $29.25 $146.25 $13.74 $68.70
R7-*-* |VARIOUS “NO PARKING” SIGNS 12x18 15 $5.12 $76.80 $7.00 $105.00 $10.50 $157.50 $12.25 $183.75 $14.00 $210.00 $15.99 $239.85
R7-*-* |VARIOUS “NO PARKING” SIGNS 18x24 15 $10.23 $153.45 $14.00 $210.00 $18.25 $273.75 $18.75 $281.25 $26.25 $393.75 $22.69 $340.35
R7-8A |[HANDICAP] PARKING ONLY 12x18 20 $5.12 $102.40 $7.00 $140.00 $14.95 $299.00 $12.75 $255.00 $14.00 $280.00 $9.56 $191.20
R11-2R |ROAD CLOSED 48x30 | BLKONW | 5 $34.10 $170.50 $46.67 $233.35 $51.65 $258.25 $48.95 $244.75 $75.00 $375.00 $38.74 $193.70
W1-**  [VARIOUS WARNING SIGNS 24x24 BLKONY [ 15 $13.64 $204.60 $18.67 $280.05 $22.10 $331.50 $38.50 $577.50 $34.00 $510.00 $17.17 $257.55
W1-7 |[DOUBLE ARROW] - Symbol 48x24 BLKONY | 10 $27.28 $272.80 $37.33 $373.30 $41.25 $412.50 $41.25 $412.50 $68.00 $680.00 $30.66 $306.60
W11-** |VARIOUS WARNING SIGNS 30x30 BLKONY [ 15 $21.31 $319.65 $29.17 $437.55 $33.30 $499.50 $51.50 $772.50 $53.25 $798.75 $32.63 $489.45
W41-**  [VARIOUS WARNING SIGNS 36x36 BLKONY | 15 $30.69 $460.35 $42.00 $630.00 $47.25 $708.75 $84.50 $1,267.50 $76.50 $1,147.50 $42.71 $640.65
S1-1  [[SCHOOL SIGN] - Symbol 30x30 FYG 5 $29.31 $146.55 $48.12 $240.60 $52.55 $262.75 $52.40 $262.00 $59.25 $296.25 $34.61 $173.05
$2-1  |[PEDESTRIAN] - Symbol 30x30 FYG 5 $29.31 $146.55 $48.12 $240.60 $52.20 $261.00 $52.40 $262.00 $59.25 $296.25 $30.56 $152.80
$3-1  [SCHOOL BUS STOP AHEAD 30x30 FYG 5 $31.09 $155.45 $48.12 $240.60 $54.70 $273.50 $54.25 $271.25 $59.25 $296.25 $34.25 $171.25
S4-3  |SCHOOL 24x8 FYG 5 $6.79 $33.95 $10.32 $51.60 $24.65 $123.25 $12.80 $64.00 $14.25 $71.25 $9.92 $49.60
OM-3L/3R [OBJECT MARKERS 12x36 BLKONY [ 10 $10.23 $102.30 $14.00 $140.00 $16.75 $167.50 $16.75 $167.50 $25.00 $250.00 $13.71 $137.10
11-6L  |ARROW 48x24 BLKONY | 10 $27.28 $272.80 $37.33 $373.30 $41.25 $412.50 $42.75 $427.50 $68.00 $680.00 $30.66 $306.60
I-14  |GULF SHORES POLICE JURISDICTION 24x18 [ WONGRN | 10 $16.68 $166.80 $14.00 $140.00 $17.00 $170.00 $27.19 $271.90 $26.25 $262.50 $22.69 $226.90
I-15  |GULF SHORES CITY LIMIT 30x18 | WONGRN | 5 $17.46 $87.30 $17.50 $87.50 $20.40 $102.00 $30.31 $151.55 $32.00 $160.00 $26.09 $130.45
B. Street Name Signs - 4" Letters on 6" Blade
E. 4TH ST WONGRN [ 3 $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $22.90 $68.70
E.8THST WONGRN | 3 $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $22.90 $68.70
E.9TH ST WONGRN [ 3 $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $22.90 $68.70
W. 13TH ST WONGRN | 3 $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88




W. 12TH ST W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
E. 18TH AVE W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
E. 23RD AVE W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
W. 23RD AVE W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
E. 24TH AVE W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $9.33 $27.99 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
BEAR CREEK DR W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $15.55 $46.65 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
BRIARWOOD DR W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $15.55 $46.65 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
BRANYON LOOP W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $15.55 $46.65 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
W. CANAL DR W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $12.44 $37.32 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
EAGLE CIR W ON GRN $8.46 $25.38 $12.44 $37.32 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
HERITAGE DR W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $15.55 $46.65 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
HILLTOP DR W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $15.55 $46.65 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
HOLLY LN W ON GRN $8.46 $25.38 $12.44 $37.32 $16.70 $50.10 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $22.90 $68.70
LAGOON WINDS DR W ON GRN $16.70 $50.10 $18.66 $55.98 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $29.35 $88.05
MICHIGAN DR W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $15.55 $46.65 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
MINNESOTA LN W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
NORTHSHORE PL W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
OFFICE PARK DR W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
PINERIDGE DR W ON GRN $11.41 $34.23 $18.66 $55.98 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
PROFESSIONAL CT W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $29.35 $88.05
PROFESSIONAL LN W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $29.35 $88.05
ROYAL OAK CIR W ON GRN $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54




SANDPIPER LN WONGRN [ 3 $13.98 $41.94 $18.66 $55.98 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
TWISTED OAK CIR WONGRN | 3 $16.70 $50.10 $21.77 $65.31 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $29.35 $88.05
W. SHORELAND DR WONGRN [ 3 $16.70 $50.10 $21.77 $65.31 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $29.35 $88.05
STARFISH LN WONGRN | 3 $11.41 $34.23 $15.55 $46.65 $20.90 $62.70 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $24.96 $74.88
SANDDOLLAR LN WONGRN [ 3 $13.98 $41.94 $21.77 $65.31 $25.45 $76.35 $36.90 $110.70 $40.00 $120.00 $27.18 $81.54
Street Name Signs - 6" Letters on 9" Blade

KNOBHILL DR WONGRN [ 2 $20.60 $41.20 $27.98 $55.96 $36.00 $72.00 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $34.28 $68.56
ISLAND CLUB WONGRN | 2 $20.60 $41.20 $27.98 $55.96 $36.00 $72.00 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $34.28 $68.56
OLEANDER COVE WONGRN [ 2 $28.60 $57.20 $27.98 $55.96 $41.55 $83.10 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $37.98 $75.96
OYSTER BAY LN WONGRN | 2 $28.60 $57.20 $27.98 $55.96 $41.55 $83.10 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $37.98 $75.96
PARKWAY SOUTH WONGRN [ 2 $28.60 $57.20 $27.98 $55.96 $46.70 $93.40 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $41.07 $82.14
E. 33RD AVE WONGRN | 2 $24.45 $48.90 $18.66 $37.32 $29.95 $59.90 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $34.28 $68.56
BLUE LAGOON DR WONGRN [ 2 $28.60 $57.20 $37.31 $74.62 $46.70 $93.40 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $41.07 $82.14
W. 1ST AVE WONGRN | 2 $20.60 $41.20 $18.66 $37.32 $29.95 $59.90 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $31.55 $63.10
E. 16TH AVE WONGRN [ 2 $20.60 $41.20 $18.66 $37.32 $29.95 $59.90 $48.80 $97.60 $50.00 $100.00 $34.28 $68.56
Specialty Signs

[NO DRINKS] - Symbol 12x12 | WONBRN | 10 $5.05 $50.50 $6.50 $65.00 $7.75 $77.50 $19.50 $195.00 $25.00 $250.00 $21.06 $210.60
[NO BIKES] — Symbol 12x12 W ON BRN | 10 $5.05 $50.50 $6.50 $65.00 $7.75 $77.50 $19.50 $195.00 $25.00 $250.00 $21.06 $210.60
[NO DOGS] - Symbol 12x12 | WONBRN | 10 $5.05 $50.50 $6.50 $65.00 $7.75 $77.50 $19.50 $195.00 $25.00 $250.00 $21.06 $210.60
USE GRILLS IN PICNIC AREA ONLY 12x12 | WONBRN | 10 $5.05 $50.50 $6.50 $65.00 $7.75 $77.50 $19.50 $195.00 $25.00 $250.00 $34.81 $348.10
PUBLIC BEACH REGULATIONS 48x30 | WONBRN | 10 $46.42 $464.20 $65.00 $650.00 $51.65 $516.50 $79.30 $793.00 $75.00 $750.00 $55.75 $557.50
BEACH SIGNS 24x30 BLKONW | 10 $21.84 $218.40 $32.50 $325.00 $51.65 $516.50 $61.50 $615.00 $60.00 $600.00 $31.78 $317.80




BEACH SIGNS — Picture in Bid Docs 18x24 [FULLCOLOR| 10 $66.78 $667.80 $21.50 $215.00 $27.15 $271.50 $45.50 $455.00 $45.00 $450.00 No Bid
NEIGHBORHOOD WATCH SIGNS 18x24  |BLK/W/ORG| 10 $10.95 $109.50 $19.50 $195.00 $17.00 $170.00 $45.50 $455.00 $45.00 $450.00 $30.48 $304.80
Galvanized U-Channel Sign Posts - 2.00 Lbs./Ft.

5’ 10 $7.90 $79.00 $8.33 $83.30 $9.70 $97.00 $15.50 $155.00 $9.75 $97.50 No Bid

6 10 $9.48 $94.80 $9.99 $99.90 $10.00 $100.00 $17.25 $172.50 $11.75 $117.50 No Bid

7 5 $11.06 $55.30 $11.66 $58.30 $16.50 $82.50 $19.95 $99.75 $13.75 $68.75 No Bid

8 5 $12.64 $63.20 $13.32 $66.60 $18.35 $91.75 $24.50 $122.50 $15.75 $78.75 No Bid

10’ 100 | $15.80 $1,580.00 $16.65 $1,665.00 $17.90 $1,790.00 $25.50 $2,550.00 $19.50 $1,950.00 No Bid

1 50 $17.38 $869.00 $19.98 $999.00 $18.10 $905.00 $27.00 $1,350.00 $21.50 $1,075.00 No Bid

12’ 100 | $18.96 $1,896.00 $19.98 $1,998.00 $21.50 $2,150.00 $28.65 $2,865.00 $23.75 $2,375.00 No Bid
Galvanized Round Posts - 16 Gauge, 0.065 Wall Thickness

10’ —2-3/8” 0.D. ROUND 75 $14.90 $1,117.50 $14.20 $1,065.00 $23.50 $1,762.50 $18.45 $1,383.75 $13.50 $1,012.50 No Bid

12’ -2-3/8” 0.D. ROUND 75 $17.88 $1,341.00 $17.04 $1,278.00 $44.70 $3,352.50 $22.14 $1,660.50 $15.95 $1,196.25 No Bid
Vandal Resistant Fasteners - Tufnut Brand or approved equal

5/16” TUFNUT 500 $0.60 $300.00 $0.73 $365.00 $1.95 $975.00 $0.68 $340.00 $0.65 $325.00 $0.39 $195.00
5/16” x 2-1/2” TUFBOLT 500 $0.30 $150.00 $0.34 $170.00 $1.50 $750.00 $0.39 $195.00 $0.65 $325.00 $0.10 $50.00
5/16” NYLON WASHER 500 $0.15 $75.00 $0.05 $25.00 $1.25 $625.00 $0.05 $25.00 $2.50 $1,250.00 $0.19 $95.00
One Man Post Drivers

3-3/4" 38 Lbs. 65" 1 $340.60 $340.60 $156.50 $156.50 $524.30 $524.30 $350.00 $350.00 No Bid No Bid

2-1/2" 21 Lbs. 30" 1 $224.69 $224.69 $87.50 $87.50 $274.40 $274.40 $245.00 $245.00 No Bid No Bid
Detachable Pullers for use to pull steel or wood posts

3-3/4” x4” 0.D. 11 Lbs. 1 $199.31 $199.31 $210.00 $210.00 $266.55 $266.55 $275.00 $275.00 No Bid No Bid




4-1/4” x 4-1/4” O.D. 18 Lbs. 1 $236.34 $236.34 $240.00 $240.00 $289.60 $289.60 $305.00 $305.00 No Bid No Bid
6-1/4” x 6-1/4” 0.D. 23 Lbs. 1 $264.15 $264.15 $280.00 $280.00 $354.00 $354.00 $365.00 $365.00 No Bid No Bid
J. Ceramic Buttons - 4" Diameter
WHITE 200 $1.10 $220.00 $0.73 $146.00 $1.55 $310.00 $0.67 $134.00 $0.50 $100.00 No Bid
YELLOW 200 $1.10 $220.00 $0.80 $160.00 $1.55 $310.00 $0.69 $138.00 $0.50 $100.00 No Bid
K. Raised Pavement Markers
BIDIRECTIONAL W,R,Y | 150 $1.30 $195.00 $1.18 $177.00 $2.80 $420.00 $0.92 $138.00 $0.78 $117.00 No Bid
BIDIRECTIONAL BLUE 150 $1.30 $195.00 $1.53 $229.50 $2.80 $420.00 $1.27 $190.50 $0.78 $117.00 No Bid
BIDIRECTIONAL — 2 COLORS W,R,Y | 150 $1.30 $195.00 $1.53 $229.50 $2.80 $420.00 $0.94 $141.00 $0.78 $117.00 No Bid
MONODIRECTIONAL R, W 150 $1.30 $195.00 $1.18 $177.00 $2.80 $420.00 $0.92 $138.00 $0.78 $117.00 No Bid
L. Sign Brackets and Hardware for Extruded Blades
VS -1 CAP 5-1/4" Blade Holder | 150 $2.94 $441.00 $2.98 $447.00 $2.80 $420.00 $4.25 $637.50 $3.75 $562.50 $4.82 $723.00
VS — 1 CROSS 5-1/4" Blade Holder | 150 $3.27 $490.50 $2.98 $447.00 $6.40 $960.00 $4.25 $637.50 $3.75 $562.50 $4.71 $706.50
VS —12 CAP 12" Blade Holder 150 $8.44 $1,266.00 $8.90 $1,335.00 | $12.85 | $1,927.50 $9.10 $1,365.00 [ $11.50 | $1,725.00 | $13.11 | $1,966.50
VS — 12 CROSS 12" Blade Holder 150 $8.44 $1,266.00 $8.90 $1,335.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $9.10 $1,365.00 $11.50 $1,725.00 $13.11 $1,966.50
M. Sign Brackets and Hardware for Extruded Blades
28" TRAFFIC CONE WITH TWO (2) REFLECTIVE COLLARS 150 | $13.59 $2,038.50 $14.47 $2,170.50 $13.75 $2,062.50 $17.45 $2,617.50 $14.75 $2,212.50 No Bid
Notes Partial Bid Partial Bid
G':: l\':\::g::“ $23,997.99 $26,101.45 $36,338.00 $36,780.55 $38,104.25 $17,771.55

Tabulated by R. Eberly 1/21/2016




